BID SPECIFICATIONS

FOR
ROAD SIGNS

SPECIFICATIONS

All signs shall meet each of the following requirements:

Made in compliance with in the most recent revision of the Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices
(MUTCD), as adopted by the Alabama Department of Transportation.

Supplied in the sizes listed in the MUTCD, and specified at the time of order.

Supplied in sheeting as specified in the Alabama Department of Transportation Standard Specifications for
Highway Construction Manual, Current Edition (as amended) and as specified at the time of order.

Made using 5052 alloy aluminum 0.080" thickness unless noted otherwise on the attached Bid Submittal
Form.

Received at the location identified by the county ordering them within thirty (30) calendar days from the date
of order. In the event that the 30" day falls on a weekend or holiday, the delivery must be by the next
business day thereafter. All signs not delivered in this time period will be reduced in price by 10%.

BID SUBMITTAL FORM

Each bidder must submit his or her bid on the Bid Submittal Form included in the Invitation to Bid package. Each
item listed on the Bid Submittal Form shall be awarded separately.

BID PRICE
Prices are for the FINISHED sign as described in each bid item. Each bid item will be awarded separately based
upon the lowest responsible bid.

PLEASE NOTE THAT ANY CHANGES TO THESE SPECIFICATION INCLUDED IN YOUR BID MAY DISQUALIFY
YOUR BID.

PRICES WILL INCLUDE ALL SHIPPING CHARGES.

We reserve the right to accept or reject any or all parts of this bid, and to award in whole or part, whichever is in our
best interest.



ITEM SIGNS SHEET Unit Price per Sign
NG| COMPLETE - Unit GRADE [ QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES [ QUANTITIES | o\ bor
DESCRIPTION (ALDOT) 1-10 11-25 26+
TYPE III 2257 2257 2257 \S/rgﬁz‘”
Each - Vulcan
. _ TYPE IV 22.57 22.57 2257 | V!
s1 Stop Sign, R1-1, | Price per Signs
30" x 30" Complet
X OMPEE 1 TvpE VI 36.71 36.71 36.71 | Yulcan
Sign Signs
TYPE IX 36.71 36.71 36.71 \S’I‘gf‘i‘“
TYPE III 32.92 32.92 32.92 \S/I‘gﬁi‘”
Each - Vulcan
. . TYPE IV 32.92 32.92 32.92 | !
S2 Stop Sign, R1-1, | Price per Signs
36" x 36" Complet
X e | TYPE VI 52.70 52.70 52.70 | Yulcan
gn Signs
TYPE IX 52.70 52.70 52.70 \S/fgﬁ";‘”
TYPE III 59.04 59.04 59.04 \S’I‘gf‘i‘“
Each - Vulcan
. . TYPE IV 59.04 59.04 59.04 | .
S3 Stop Sign, R1-1, | Price per Signs
48" x 48" Complet
X OMPEE 1 TvpPE VI 94.20 94.20 94.20 | Yulcan
Sign Signs
TYPE IX 94.20 94.20 94.20 X.Lgﬁ?”
TYPE IIl 25.16 25.16 25.16 \S/fgﬁ";‘”
Advance Traffic | Each - TYPE IV 25.16 25.16 25,16 | Yulcan
sa Control Sign, Price per Signs
W3-1, W3-2, W3- | Complete Vulcan
3. 30" x 30" Sign TYPE Vil 38.62 38.62 38.62 | gy
TYPE IX 38.62 38.62 3g.62 | Yulcan
Signs
TYPE III 36.15 36.15 36.15 \S/I‘gﬁ";‘”
Advance Traffic | Each - TYPE IV 36.15 36.15 36.15 | Yulcan
S5 Control Sign, Price per Signs
W3-1, W3-2, W3- | Complete Vulcan
3, 36" x 36" Sign TYPE VIl 55.54 55.54 55.54 | Sion
TYPE IX 55.54 55.54 55.54 | Yulcan
Signs
TYPE IIl 12.06 12.06 12.06 | Yulcan
Signs
Each - Vulcan
. - TYPE IV 12.06 12.06 12.06 |
S6 Yield, R1-2, 30" | Price per Signs
30" x 30" Complete
XS0 P TYPE VIl 19.06 19.06 19.06 | Yulcan
Sign Signs
TYPE IX 19.06 19.06 19.06 | Yulcan
Signs




Vulcan

TYPE Ill 16.21 16.21 16.21 | !

Signs

Each - Vulcan

. - TYPE IV 16.21 16.21 16.21 | !
S7 Yield, R1-2, 36" | Price per Signs
x 36" x 36" Complete Vulcan
. TYPE VIII 24.60 24.60 24.60 | !

Sign Signs

TYPE IX 24.60 24.60 24.60 | Yulcan

Signs

TYPE Il 32.28 32.28 32.2g | Vulcan

Signs

Each - Vulcan

o | Yield, R12, 48" | Price per TYPE IV 32.28 32.28 32.28 | giono

X 48" x 48 Complete | +vpe vy 49.98 49.98 49.98 | Yulcan

Sign Signs

TYPE IX 49.98 49.98 49.9g | Vulcan

Signs

TYPE II 33.51 31.54 30.47 | Yulcan

Signs

TYPE Il 33.27 33.27 33.27 | Vulcan

Each - Signs

sg | Highway-Rail | Price per | = 1y e 33.27 33.27 3327 | Yulcan

Grade Crossing | Complete Signs
Sign

W10-1, 36" Dia : TYPE VIII 53.27 53.27 53.27 \S/I‘gﬁi‘”

TYPE IX 53.27 53.27 53.27 | Yulcan

Signs

TYPE Il 23.57 22.19 21.43 | Yulcan

Signs

TYPE IIl 23.51 23.51 2351 | Yulcan

Each - Signs

Highway-Rail Price per Vulcan

S10 | Grade Crossing | Complote TYPE IV 23.51 23.51 2351 | giong

W10-1, 30"Dia | 9" TYPE VIl 37.39 37.39 37.39 \S/fgﬁ";‘”

TYPE IX 37.39 37.39 37.39 | Yulcan

Signs

TYPE Il 28.41 21.39 20.66 | Yulcan

Signs

TYPE IIl 22.61 22.61 2261 | Yulcan

Each - Signs

s11 SchooIAd_vanced Price per TYPE IV 22 61 22 61 22 61 V_ulcan

Warning Complete Signs
Sign

S1-1, 30" x 30" g TYPE VIII 36.50 36.50 36.50 | Yulcan

Signs

Fluorescent Vulcan

o 38.70 38.70 38.70 | g

G&C

Pﬁgghp;er TYPE Il 32.63 32.63 3263 | g o

si2 Complete | TYPE Il 33.18 33.18 33.18 | S&C

Sign Supply

School Advanced TYPE IV 33.18 33.18 33.18 | G&C




Warning Supply
" " G&C
S1-1, 36" x 36 TYPE VI 48.67 48.67 48.67
Supply
Fluorescent G&C
Y-G 51.25 51.25 51.25 Supply
TYPE Il 3.05 2.87 0,77 | Yulcan
Signs
ROW sign, white Each - \S/iUIrC]zm
background with | Price per 9
S13 black letters, no | Complete TYPE Il 260 2 60 260
border 6" X 12" Sign ' ' '
U= SIERS Unit SEEEE QUANTITIEsunI(tQLPJ;I\(l:\leTrl)'I('elrEzI rIQUANTITIES
NO DESCRIPTION (ALDOT) 1-10 11-25 26+ VENDOR
Weight limit signs TYPE Il 31.50 31.50 3150 | S8
(R12-5 with 6 Each - Supply
s14 | UWucksilhouettes; | Price per | rype 29.66 29.66 29.66 | S&C
design available | Complete Supply
on request) 24" X Sign
auest J TYPE IV 29.66 29.66 29.66 | S4C
Supply
All regulatory TYPE Il 3.92 3.92 3.92 | G&C
signs (except Price per Supply
s15 | RiZSbelow), | qooe | TYPE N 3.78 3.78 3.78 | &
MUTCD Supply
Foot
Chapters 2B & G&C
5B TYPE IV 3.78 3.78 3.78 S
upply
G&C
. upply
MUTCD Price per G&C
S16 Chapters 2C & Square TYPE IlI 3.78 3.78 3.78 Suppl
5C (except W3-1, |  Foot - %’y
W3-2, W3-3) TYPE IV 3.78 3.78 3.78 | S&
Supply
TYPE I 4.40 4.40 4.40 G&C
: Supply
All construction G&C
warning signs, | Price per TYPE Il 3.78 3.78 3.78 Supply
S17 MUTCD Square G&C
Chapters 6F & Foot TYPE IV 3.78 3.78 3.78
5G Supply
Fluorescent 5.50 5.50 5.50 | G
upply
TYPE I 3.92 3.92 3.92 G&C
Supply
All school signs, Pri ; G&C
MUTCD Chapter ce pe TYPE Il 3.78 3.78 3.78
S18 | 7B (excepts1-1 | Sduare Supply
. Foot
listed above) TYPE IV 3.78 3.78 3.78 G&C
Supply
Fluorescent 6.35 6.35 6.35 | G&C
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Y-G Supply
All grade TYPE Il 3.92 3.92 3.92 g‘f‘;ly
crossing signs, Price per G&C
S19 | MUTCD Chapter Square TYPE Il 3.78 3.78 3.78 Suppl
8B (Except W10- |  Foot G&%) y
1 listed above) TYPE IV 3.78 3.78 3.78
Supply
o TYPE II 5.23 5.23 5.23 | &
All Guide signs, Price per Supply
S20 MUTCD Square | TYPEII 5.05 5.05 5.05 | S&C
Chapters 2D & Eoot Supply
5D G&C
TYPE IV 5.05 5.05 5.05
Supply
TYPE Il 3.95 3.72 3.59 \S/rgrc]i”
Hazard Board, Price per vulcan
S21 | yellow and black, | Square TYPE I 4.01 3.92 3.83 Sians
48"x24" Foot gl
TYPE IV 4.01 3.92 3.83 | Yulcan
Signs
Street name sign Vulcan
with green or biue TYPE Il 6.92 6.47 6.11 | ions
sheeting ON ) Vulcan
BOTH SIDES, no | Price per TYPE 1l 7.19 7.19 7.19 .
S22 message, 0.100" Square Signs
thick, 9" wide, Foot
various lengths to TYPE IV 7.19 7.19 7.19 | ulcan
be specified at time ' ' ' Signs
of order
Street name signs Vulcan
with green or blue TYPE Il 10.46 9.81 9.23 | ginrs
sheeting ON BOTH Vv gl
SIDES, street name, ulcan
e & uppercase | price per TYPE Il 10.20 10.20 1020 | oo
w/ 4.5" lowercase
S23 letters ON BOTH Square
SIDES, 0.100" thick, Foot Vulcan
9" wide, various TYPE IV 10.20 10.20 10.20 .
lengths to be Signs
specified at time of
order.
Street name signs G&C
with green or biue TYPE II 6.23 6.23 623 | Sy
sheeting ON ) G&C
BOTH SIDES, no Price per TYPE 1l 6.03 6.03 6.03 |
S24 message, 0.080" Square Supply
thick, 6" wide, Foot
various lengths to TYPE IV 6.03 6.03 6.03 | &€
be specified at time ' ' ' Supply
of order.
Street name signs Vulcan
with green or blue TYPE Il 9.76 9.15 861 | Signs
sheeting ON BOTH Vulcan
SIDES, street name, X
“White 4" uppercase Price per TYPE Il 9.95 9.95 9.95 Signs
S25 w/ 3" lowercase Square
letters ON BOTH Foot Vul
SIDES, 0.080" thick, ulcan
e e, various TYPE IV 9.95 9.95 995 | Sions

lengths to be
specified at time of




order. |

PRICE EACH POST

ITEM (orders of (250, 250+
NO SIGN POST UNIT (50 POSTS) | 100, 150, OR | increments | VENDOR
200 POSTS) of 50)
Sign Post - Green Painted - G&C
S26 20 Ib/Et - 12 Ft. Each 15.78 15.78 15.78 Supply
Sign Post - Green Painted - G&C
S27 20 Ib/Et - 10 Ft. Each 13.15 13.15 13.15 Supply
Sign Post - Green Painted - G&C
S28 20Ib/Ft. - 8 Et. Each 10.52 10.52 10.52 Supply
Sigh Post - Galvanized - 3.0 G&C
S29 Ib/ET - 10 ET Each 25.10 25.10 25.10 Supply
Sigh Post - Galvanized - 3.0 G&C
S30 Ib/ET - 12 ET Each 30.12 30.12 30.12 Supply
Sigh Post - Galvanized - 3.0 G&C
S31 Ib/ET - 14 ET Each 35.14 35.14 35.14 Supply
S32 Delineator Post - 1.12 Ib./Ft. Each 516 516 516 G&C
- 6 Ft. Supply
PRICE PRICE
ITEM STREET NAME EACH EACH
NO MOUNTING UNIT BRACKET BRACKET | VENDOR
BRACKETS (50 each (100 each
order) order)
Cross Bracket, for flat blade
signs, 5 1/4" blade holder,
S33 with cadmium plated set Each 3.50 3.50 | G&C Supply
screws
Caps for U-Channel posts,
street name sign parallel with
U-channel mounting surface .
S34 for flat blade signs, 5 1/4" Each 3.74 3.74 | Vulcan Signs
blade holder with cadmium
plated set screws
Caps for U-Channel posts, Vulcan Signs
street name sign
perpendicular to U-channel
S35 mounting surface for flat Each 3.74 3.74
blade signs, 5 1/4" blade
holder with cadmium plated
set screws
SHEET
ROLL GOODS | UNIT GRADE | PRICEPER
ITEM (ALDOT) ROLL
NO VENDOR
Sheeting, 6"x50 TYPE Il 79.95 | Vulcan Signs
yard roll on 3 TYPE IIl 112.00 | Vulcan Signs
diameter core,
336 pressure PER
sensitive, ALL ROLL )
available colors TYPE IV 112.00 | Vulcan Signs
(except

Fluorescent)




S37

Sheeting, 9"x50
yard roll on 3”
diameter core,

pressure
sensitive, ALL
available colors
(except
Fluorescent)

PER
ROLL

TYPE I

111.56

G&C Supply

TYPE llI

169.60

G&C Supply

TYPE IV

169.60

G&C Supply

S38

Sheeting, 12"x50
yard roll on 3”
diameter core,

pressure
sensitive, ALL
available colors
(except
Fluorescent)

PER
ROLL

TYPE I

148.30

G&C Supply

TYPE llI

226.25

G&C Supply

TYPE IV

226.25

G&C Supply

S39

Sheeting, 18"x50
yard roll on 3”
diameter core,

pressure
sensitive, ALL
available colors
(except
Fluorescent)

PER
ROLL

TYPE I

222.40

G&C Supply

TYPE llI

339.50

G&C Supply

TYPE IV

339.50

G&C Supply

S40

Sheeting, 24"x50
yard roll on 3”
diameter core,

pressure
sensitive, ALL
available colors
(except
Fluorescent)

PER
ROLL

TYPE I

296.79

G&C Supply

TYPE llI

452.40

G&C Supply

TYPE IV

452.40

G&C Supply

S41

Sheeting, 30"x50
yard roll on 3”
diameter core,

pressure
sensitive, ALL
available colors
(except
Fluorescent)

PER
ROLL

TYPE Il

370.99

G&C Supply

TYPE llI

565.50

G&C Supply

TYPE IV

565.50

G&C Supply

S42

Sheeting, 36"x50
yard roll on 3”
diameter core,

pressure
sensitive, ALL
available colors
(except
Fluorescent)

PER
ROLL

TYPE

445.19

G&C Supply

TYPE Il

678.99

G&C Supply

TYPE IV

678.99

G&C Supply

S43

Sheeting, 48"x50
yard roll on 3”
diameter core,

pressure
sensitive, ALL
available colors

(except

PER
ROLL

TYPE Il

593.00

G&C Supply

TYPE llI

905.00

G&C Supply

TYPE IV

905.00

G&C Supply




Fluorescent)

Sheeting, roll on 24" x 50 Yard 1152.00 | Vulcan Signs
3" diameter core, 30" x 50 Yard 1440.00 | Vulcan Signs
pressure PER " v 172 wvul ;
S44 sensitive, ROLL 36" x 50 Yard 8.00 | Vulcan Signs
Fluorescent 48" x 50 Yard 2304.00 | Vulcan Signs
Yellow-Green
Sheeting, roll on 24" x 50 Yard 1152.00 | Vulcan Signs
3" diameter core, 30" x 50 Yard 1440.00 | Vulcan Signs
pressure PER [ 36" x 50 Yard 1728.00 | Vulcan Si
S45 sensitive, ROLL X A - wican >igns
Fluorescent 48" x 50 Yard 2304.00 | Vulcan Signs
Yellow
Sheeting, roll on 24" x 50 Yard 834.00 | Vulcan Signs
3" diameter core, oER 30" x 50 Yard 1042.50 | Vulcan Signs
pressure 36" x 50 Yard 1251.00 | Vulcan Si
S46 sensitive, ROLL X ar uican Signs
Fluorescent 48" x 50 Yard 1668.00 | Vulcan Signs
Orange
Vulcan Signs
Low Tack PER
S47 | Application Tape ROLL N/A 20.01
6"x100 yard roll
ITEM Unit Price per Sq. Ft.
NO Sign Blanks UNIT QUANTITIES QU,;ZI_TSI;'IES QUANTITIES
1-25 Blanks 51+ Blanks | VENDOR
Blanks
Aluminum
S48 | Diamond/Square, | Sq. Ft. 2.33 2.28 2.25 | Vulcan Signs
0.080 Ga.
Aluminum
S49 | Rectangular, Sq. Ft. 2.33 2.28 2.25 | Vulcan Signs
0.080 Gage
Aluminum Circle,
S50 0.080 Gage Sq. Ft. 2.15 2.15 2.15 G&C Supply
Aluminum
S51 | Octagon, 0.080 Sq. Ft. 2.15 2.15 2.15 G&C Supply
Gage
SHEET Unit Price per Face
ILEOM DEISGCNRII::‘T(I:(EN UNIT GRADE QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES
(ALDOT) 1-10 11-25 26+ VENDOR
TYPE Il 9.78 9.78 9.78 G&cC
Supply
. Each- | TYPEIV 0.78 9.78 0.78 | S8
Stop Sign Face, X Supply
S62 R1-1 30" x 30" Price per G&C
’ Face TYPE VI 24.78 24.78 24.78
Supply
TYPE IX 24.78 24.78 24.78 | S&C
Supply
Stop Sign Face, Each - G&C
S53 R1-1, 36" x 36" | Price per TYPE Il 13.32 13.32 13.32 Supply




Face

G&C

TYPE IV 13.32 13.32 13.32
Supply
TYPE Vil 34.95 34.95 34.095 | S&C
Supply
TYPE IX 34.95 34.95 34.95 | S&C
Supply
TYPE Il 25.75 25.75 2575 | G&C
Supply
. Each - TYPE IV 25.75 25.75 2575 | G&C
Stop Sign Face, . Supply
S54 R1-1 48" x 48" Price per G&C
' Face TYPE VI 65.50 65.50 65.50
Supply
TYPE IX 65.50 65.50 65.50 | S&C
Supply
TYPE III 13.12 13.12 13.12 \S/rgf]‘;‘”
Advance Traffic Vulcan
Control Sign Each - TYPE IV 13.12 13.12 1312 | &0
S55 | Face, W3-1, W3- | Price per vg|
2, W3-3, 30" x Face TYPE VIII 26.00 26.00 26.00 | Lucan
30" Signs
TYPE IX 26.00 26.00 26.00 | Yulcan
Signs
TYPE III 18.90 18.90 18.90 \S/I‘gf]";‘”
Advance Traffic Vulcan
Control Sign Each - TYPE IV 18.90 18.90 18.90 Signs
S56 Face, W3-1, Price per Vulcan
W3-2, W3-3, 36" | Face TYPE VIII 37.44 37.44 37.44 | WY
X 36" Signs
TYPE IX 37.44 37.44 37.44 | Yulcan
Signs
TYPE Il 5.51 5.51 5.51 | Yulcan
Signs
Yield Sign Face, | Each- | TYPEIV 5.51 5.51 5.51 \S’I‘gﬁ‘;‘”
S57 R1-2, Price per vul
30"x30"x30" Face TYPE VI 13.05 13.05 13.05 Si%qﬁin
TYPE IX 13.05 13.05 13.05 | Yulcan
Signs
TYPE Il 7.07 7.07 7.07 | Yulcan
Signs
Yield Sign Face, | Each- | TYPEIV 7.07 7.07 7.07 \S’I‘Jg"r:]";‘“
S58 | R1-2, 36"x36" | Price per v
x36" Face TYPE Vil 15.66 15.66 15.66 S.“ can
igns
TYPE IX 15.66 15.66 15.66 | Yulcan
Signs
o TYPE III 14.40 14.40 14.40 | Yulcan
Yield Sign Face, | Each - Signs
S59 R1-2, Price per Vulcan
g oot TYPE IV 14.40 14.40 14.40 | §ood
TYPE VIII 33.30 33.30 33.30 | Vulcan




Signs

TYPE IX 33.30 33.30 33.30 | Yulcan
Signs
Highway-Rail TYPE Il 13.85 13.85 13.85 SELCI
Grade Crossing G&FZ? y
Sign Face Each - TYPE IV 13.85 13.85 13.85 | o °
S60 Price per G&%) y
W10-1, 36" Dia Face TYPE VI 34.96 34.96 34.96
Supply
TYPE IX 34.96 34.96 34.96 | &€
Supply
Highway-Rail TYPE 1l 10.19 10.19 10.19 Slifiﬂ
Grade Crossing G&C y
Sign Face Each - TYPE IV 10.19 10.19 10.19 | o
S61 Price per G&FZ? y
W10-1, 30" Dia Face TYPE VI 25.18 25.18 25.18
Supply
TYPE IX 25.18 25.18 25.18 G&C
Supply
TYPE Ili 10.19 10.19 10.19 | G&C
Supply
School Advanced G&C
Warning Sign Each - TYPE IV 10.19 10.19 10.19 Supol
S62 Face Price per pply
S1-1, 30" x 30" Face TYPE VIl 25.18 25.18 25.18 | S&C
Supply
Fluorescent G&C
Y-G 27.06 27.06 27.06 Supply
TYPE Il 13.85 13.85 13.85 | S&C
Supply
School Advanced GaC
Warning Sign Each - TYPE IV 13.85 13.85 13.85 | o oo
S63 Face Price per upply
Face
" " G&C
S1-1, 36" x 36 TYPE VI 35.80 35.80 35.80
Supply
ITEM SIGN FACES SHEET Unit Price per Sign Face Sqg. Ft.
NO ONLY - UNIT GRADE QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES
DESCRIPTION (ALDOT) 1-10 11-25 26+ VENDOR
G&C
TYPE Il 1.34 1.34 1.34
All regulatory Price per Supply
sign faces , Face G&C
S64 MUTCD Square TYPE Il 1.62 1.62 1.62 Suppl
Chapters 2B & q PPl
Foot G&C
oB TYPE IV 1.62 1.62 1.62
Supply
o , TYPE II 1.34 1.34 1.34 | G&C
All warning signs, | Price per Supply
MUTCD Face G&C
S65 Chapters 2C & Square TYPE 1l 1.34 1.34 1.34 Supply
5C Foot G&C
TYPE IV 1.62 1.62 1.62
Supply
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Vulcan

TYPE Il 1.35 1.27 1.27 Sj
All construction V|g|ns
i ulcan
warning signs, P“Fcaecgef TYPE Il 1.85 1.78 1.78 Signs
S66 MUTCD Square Vulcan
Chapters 6F & g TYPE IV 1.85 1.78 1.78 .
5G oot Signs
Fluorescent 3.19 3.19 3.19 | Yulcan
Signs
TYPE Il 1.34 1.34 1.34 G&C
Supply
All school signs, | Price per TYPE III 1,62 1.62 162 | G&C
sg7 | MUTCD Chapter Face - 0 © Supply
7B (except S1-1 Square G&C
listed above) Foot TYPE IV 1.62 1.62 1.62 Supply
Fluorescent G&C
Y-G 3.17 3.17 3.17 Supply
G&C
TYPE Il 1.34 1.34 1.34
cro?élir?gr;asdigns Price per Supply
S68 | MUTCD Chapter SF?J‘;?e TYPE Il 1.62 1.62 1.62 SS‘CI
8B (Except W10- goot G&%’ Y
1 listed above) TYPE IV 1.62 1.62 1.62
Supply
. . ) TYPE Il 2.74 2.74 2.74 G&C
All Guide signs, | Price per Supply
MUTCD Face G&C
S69 Chapters 2D & Square TYPE Il 2.84 2.84 2.84 Supply
5D Foot G&C
TYPE IV 2.84 2.84 2.84
Supply
TYPE Il 1.35 1.35 1.35 | Yulcan
Signs
Hazard Board, | "NC€Per | TvpE 1.85 1.78 1,78 | Yulcan
Face Signs
S70 | yellow and black,
g A Square Vulcan
48"x24 Foot Signs
TYPE IV 1.85 1.78 1.78 9
Pressure Price per Packet of 25 of same Letter/No.
ITEM Sensitive Cut SHEET
Upper/Lower UNIT GRADE : . :
NO Letters and (ALDOT) Series B Series D Series E(M) VENDOR
Numbers
2 Inch cut
S71 | Letters and Pack of Black 1.94 2.57 | NOBID Vulcan
25 Signs
Numbers
3 Inch Cut
S72 | Letters and Pack of Black 2.57 2.80 | NO BID Vulcan
25 Signs
Numbers
5 Inch Cut
s73 | Letters and Pack of Black 3.92 5.03 6.06 | Yulcan
25 Signs
Numbers
Pack of Vulcan
S74 | 8 Inch Cut 25 Black 7.04 9.84 12.62 Signs
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Letters and

Numbers
Vulcan
. . TYPE Il 2.25 4.30 | NO BID .
2 inch White Signs
s7s | Reflective cut | Packol | rypg 2.25 4.30 | NO BID vulcan
Letters and 25 Signs
Numbers TYPE IV 2.25 4.30 | NO BID Vulcan
Signs
Vulcan
. TYPE Il 4.30 4.99 | NO BID .
3 Inch White Signs
s76 | Reflective Cut | Packof | pype 4.30 4.99 | NOBID vulean
Letters and 25 Signs
Numbers TYPE IV 4.30 4.99 | NO BID \S’.“'C""”
igns
4.5 Inch TYPE Il 8.66 | NO BID NO BID \S/rgf]i”
White
_— . Pack of Vulcan
S77 | Reflective cut o5 TYPE Il 8.66 | NO BID NO BID Signe
Letters and vulcan
Numbers TYPE IV 8.66 | NO BID NO BID .
Signs
TYPE I 8.08 11.65 14.95 | Yulcan
Signs
5 Inch White TYPE Ill 8.08 11.65 14.95 \S/.“'C""”
- igns
Reflective cut | Pack of
S78 | === Vulcan
Letters and 25 .
Numbers Signs
TYPE IV 8.08 11.65 14.95
- TYPE Il 11.28 16.03 20,79 | Yulcan
6 Inch White ' ) ' Signs
Reflective cut | Pack of Vulcan
s79 | Rellective TYPE Il 11.28 16.03 20.79 | =
Letters and 25 Signs
Numbers TYPE IV 11.28 16.03 20,79 | Yulcan
Signs
Vulcan
8 Inch White TYPE Il 18.12 27.11 32.69 | gy
sso | Reflective Cut | Packof | pype 18.12 27.11 32.69 | vulcan
Letters and 25 Signs
Numbers TYPE IV 18.12 27.11 32.69 | Yulcan
Signs
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