ALL 67 COUNTIES ARE ELIGIBLE TO PURCHASE

TRAFFIC MARKING MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS

Ingevity ENNIS-FLINT, | ENNIS-FLINT, | CROWN
Corp. Ingevity Corp. INC. INC. USA

Paint Materials Gallon 5 Gallon Bucket Gallon 5 Gallon Bucket| Gallon
Paint, Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, Bulk IBC Storage System $13.17 $13.00 $14.49
Delivered $ /Gallon
Paint, Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, Bulk IBC Storage System $13.17 $13.10 $14.18
Delivered $ /Gallon
Paint, Class 1H, High Build, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon Bucket $15.64 $78.20 $14.50 $72.50 $89.95
Delivered $ /Each
Paint, Class 1H, High Build, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon Bucket $15.64 $78.20 $14.60 $72.50 $88.40
Delivered $ /Each
Paint, Class 1, Acrylic Water Borne, Yellow Traffic Line, Bulk IBC Storage System $11.66 $12.00 $13.36
Delivered $ /Gallon
Paint, Class 1, Acrylic Water Borne, White Traffic Line, Bulk IBC Storage System $11.66 $12.10 $13.07
Delivered $ /Gallon
Paint, Class 1, Acrylic Water Borne, Yellow Traffic Line, 5 Gallon Bucket $14.07 $70.35 $13.50 $67.50 $84.30
Delivered $ /Each
Paint, Class 1, Acrylic Water Borne, White Traffic Line, 5 Gallon Bucket $14.07 $70.35 $13.60 $68.00 $82.85
Delivered $ /Each
Paint, Class 1, Acrylic Water Borne, Blue Traffic Line, 5 Gallon Bucket $18.00 $90.00 $15.00 $75.00 $85.00

Delivered |

$ [/Each |

Indicates Lowest Bid Price




ALL 67 COUNTIES ARE ELIGIBLE TO PURCHASE

TRAFFIC MARKING MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS

. ENNIS-FLINT, | CROWN
Glass Spheres and Raised Pavement Markers Ingevity Corp. INC. USA
Glass Spheres, AASHTO Standard Type 1, Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets $0.60 No Bid $0.60
Delivered |$ /Pound
Glass Spheres, AASHTO Standard Type 4, Drop on Application, Shipped in 50-90 Ib Moisture Proof Bags on Pallets No Bid No Bid $1.89
Delivered |$ /Pound
Raised Pavement Marker, Class AH, Type 1-A No Bid $1.25 No Bid
Delivered |$ /Each
Raised Pavement Marker, Class AH, Type 1-B No Bid $1.25 No Bid
Delivered |$ /Each
Raised Pavement Marker, Class AH, Type 2-A No Bid $1.25 No Bid
Delivered |$ /Each
Raised Pavement Marker, Class AH, Type 2-B No Bid $1.25 No Bid
Delivered |$ /Each
Raised Pavement Marker, Class AH, Type 2-C No Bid $1.25 No Bid
Delivered |$ /Each
Raised Pavement Marker, Class AH, Type 2-D No Bid $1.25 No Bid
Delivered |$ /Each
Raised Pavement Marker, Class AH, Type 2-E No Bid $1.25 No Bid

Delivered |[$

/Each

Note: Price for raised pavement markers for Ennis-Flint is each sold in a box of 100.

Indicates L

owest Bid Price




ALL 67 COUNTIES ARE ELIGIBLE TO PURCHASE

2025-2026 TRAFFIC MARKING MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS

Ingevity | ENNIS-FLINT, | CROWN
Corp. INC. USA

Thermoplastic Preformed
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 6” X 3’ White Line, 125 mil, 20 Per Pack $57.60 $65.00 $56.09
Delivered [$ [PKG ] [ [ [ | [ |

I | I I I | I I I
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 6” X 3’ Yellow Line, 125 mil, 20 Per Pack $60.57 $75.00 $58.97
Delivered [$ [PKG ] [ [ [ | [ |

I | I I I | I I I
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 12” X 3° White Line, 125 mil, 10 Per Pack $57.60 $65.00 $56.09
Delivered [$ [PKG ] [ [ [ | [ |

I | I I I | I I I
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 12” X 3’ Yellow Line, 125 mil, 10 Per Pack $60.57 $75.00 $58.97
Delivered [$ [PKG ] [ [ [ | [ |

I | I I I | I I |
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 24” X 3" White Line, 125 mil, 5 Per Pack $57.60 $65.00 $56.09
Delivered [$ [PKG ] [ [ [ | [ |

I | I I I | I I I
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 24” X 3’ Yellow Line, 125 mil, 5 Per Pack $60.57 $75.00 $58.97
Delivered [$ [PKG ] [ [ [ | [ |

I | I I I | I | I
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 48” X 48” White on Blue Handicap Symbol, 125 mil, 2 Per Pack $134.70 $253.00 $111.80
Delivered $ [PkG ] I I I I I I I I

I | I I I | | I I | I
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 24” X 36” Yield Line (Shark’s Teeth), 125 mil, 10 Per Pack $77.55 $105.00 $72.16
Delivered $ [PkG ] I I I I I I I I

I | I I I | I I I I |
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 8’ 2 X 6’ 3” Turn Arrow Standard Rev, 125 mil, 2 Per Pack $126.88 $110.00 $117.92
Delivered [$ [PKG ] [ [ [ [ [ | |

I | I I I | I I I |
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 8’ 2 X 6’ 3” Turn Arrow Standard Left, 125 mil, 2 Per Pack $126.88 $110.00 $117.92
Delivered  |$ /PKG
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 8’ 2" X 6’ 3” Turn Arrow Standard Right, 125 mil, 2 Per Pack $126.88 $110.00 $117.92
Delivered  |$ /PKG
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 13’ 1” X 7” 4” Combo Arrow Standard Rev, 125 mil $114.42 $110.00 $106.38
Delivered  [$ /Each
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 13’ 1” X 7” 4” Combo Arrow Standard Left, 125 mil $114.42 $110.00 $106.38
Delivered  [$ /Each
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 13’ 1” X 7” 4” Combo Arrow Standard Right, 125 mil $114.42 $110.00 $106.38
Delivered  [$ /Each
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 8" ONLY, 125 mil $92.10 $99.75 $84.00

Delivered

$

/Each

Indicates Lowest Bid Price
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