2017 COUNTY JOINT BID AWARD AND RENEWED ITEMS LIST

HEAVY EQUIPMENT

Asphalt Milling Attachments

Asphalt Milling Attachment — Option A
Asphalt Milling Attachment — Option B
Asphalt Milling Attachment — Option C

Backhoes

Heavy Duty Backhoe
Medium Duty Backhoe
Light Duty Backhoe

Dump Trucks
16’ Steel Dump Body Option A (Manual)
16’ Steel Dump Body Option A (Automatic)
16’ Steel Dump Body Option B (Manual)
16’ Steel Dump Body Option B (Automatic)

(

(

(

(

16’ Steel Dump Body Option C (Manual)
16’ Steel Dump Body Option C (Automatic)
16’ Steel Dump Body Option D (Manual)
16’ Steel Dump Body Option D (Automatic)
16’ Steel Dump Body Option E (Manual)
16’ Steel Dump Body Option E (Automatic)
16’ Steel Dump Body Option F (Manual)
16’ Steel Dump Body Option F (Automatic)
Heavy Duty Dump Chassis Option A
Heavy Duty Dump Chassis Option B
Heavy Duty Dump Chassis Option C
Lowboy Tractor Option A

Lowboy Tractor Option B

RENEWED ITEMS HIGHLIGHTED

Price

$100,260.00
$113,890.00
$144,460.00

Price
$117,243.00
$101,225.00
$88,076.00

Price
$21,492.00
$21,926.00
$23,464.00
$24,239.00
$17,402.00
$17,836.00
$23,267.00
$23,701.00
$25,094.00
$26,354.00
$22,692.00
$22,126.00
$119,310.00
$117,094.00
$120,471.00
$114,989.00
$125,700.00

ltem Make/Model
AZ 300- B
AZ 500-B
AZ 600-B

[tem Make/Model
430F2

John Deere 310 SLHL
416F2

ltem Make/Model
Warren FL-16 21 YD
Warren FL-16 21 YD
21 Yard Stampede
21 Yard Stampede
Warren WXL-16
Warren WXL-16
Warren FL-16
Warren FL-16
Maverick-HD 16x60
Maverick- HD 16x60
Warren WXL-16
Warren WXL-16
GUT713

4700SB

T800

CHU613

W900L

Company
Asphalt Zipper Inc.

Asphalt Zipper Inc.
Asphalt Zipper Inc.

Company

Thompson Tractor
Warrior Tractor & Equipment
Thompson Tractor

Compan
Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc.

Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc.
Childersburg Truck
Childersburg Truck

Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc.
Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc.
Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc.
Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc.
Childersburg Truck
Childersburg Truck

Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc.
Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc.
Gulf Coast Truck & Equipment
Empire Trucks

Kenworth of Montgomery, Inc.
Gulf Coast Truck & Equipment
Kenworth of Montgomery, Inc.



Excavators

Track Mount Excavator Option A-1

Track Mount Excavator Option A-2

Track Mount Excavator 25 Ton Option B-1
Track Mount Excavator 25 Ton Option B-2
Track Mount Excavator Option C-1

Track Mount Excavator Option C-2
Compact Track Mount Excavator Option D-1
Compact Track Mount Excavator Option D-2
Mini Track Excavator Option E-1

Motorgraders

Motorgrader Option A
Motorgrader Option B
Motorgrader Option C
Motorgrader Option D
Motorgrader Option E
Motorgrader Option F

One Man Pothole Patchers
One Man Pothole Patcher — Option A
One Man Pothole Patcher — Option B

Patcher
Trailer Mount Patcher

PTO Tractors
85 PTO Tractor
95 PTO Tractor
110 PTO Tractor

Road Widener
6ft Road Widener
8ft Road Widener

Price
$236,776.00
$240,283.00
$165,586.00
$181,233.00
$149,789.00
$165,414.00
$89,941.00
$105,704.00
$52,793.00

Price

$290,872.00
$319,330.00
$265,327.00
$293,337.00
$238,442.00
$269,686.00

Price
$215,400.00
$205,777.00

Price
$53,627.00

Price

$60,033.83
$82,500.67
$97,492.06

Price
$134,844.00
$181,000.00

[tem Make/Model
John Deere 300 GLC
Volvo EC300E

Case CX210D

John Deere 210GLC
Volvo EC160E

John Deere 160GLC
Case CX80

308E2 CR SB
Takevichi TB240

[tem Make/Model
140M3

140M3 AWD

12M3

12M3 AWD

John Deere 670 G
John Deere 672GP

Item Make/Model
Spray Patcher RA-400
Duramax

ltem Make/Model
T7500

Item Make/Model
5100 M
6120 M
6145 M

Item Make/Model
Midland SPR-6
Midland SPR-8

Compan
Warrior Tractor & Equipment

Cowin Equipment

Cowin Equipment

Warrior Tractor & Equipment
Cowin Equipment

Warrior Tractor Equipment
Cowin Equipment
Thompson Tractor

Cowin Equipment

Compan
Thompson Tractor

Thompson Tractor
Thompson Tractor
Thompson Tractor
Warrior Tractor & Equipment
Warrior Tractor & Equipment

Company
Tractor & Equipment

Coblenz Equipment & Parts

Compan
Warren Power Attachments

Company
Sun South LLC.

Sun South LLC.
Sun South LLC.

Company

Pittman Tractor Co.
Pittman Tractor Co.



Bulldozer

95 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer
95 HP Medium Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer
105 HP Hydrostatic Bulldozer

110 HP Hydrostatic Bulldozer

130 HP Hydrostatic Bulldozer

Single drum Vibratory Roller
7.5 Single Drum Vibratory Roller

Skid Steer Loader

Skid Steer Loader w/Mulcher
Skid Steer Loader Attachment 1
Skid Steer Loader Attachment 2
Skid Steer Loader Attachment 3
Skid Steer Loader Attachment 4
Skid Steer Loader Attachment 5

Trailers

28’ Half Round End Dump
35 Ton Lowboy Trailer

55 Ton Lowboy Trailer

Wheel Loader

3 CY Wheel Loader
3.65 CY Wheel Loader
5.50 CY Wheel Loader

Price

No Award
$125,903.00
$131,123.00
$154,286.00
No Award

Price
$100,668.00

Price
$100,616.00
$9,022.00
$9,571.00
$10,533.00
$7,101.00
$23,092.00

Price

$43,020.00
$35,870.00
$48,875.00

Price
$139,047.00
$172,264.00
$234,797.00

ltem Make/Model

CASE 850M
CASE 850M
CASE 1150M

Item Make/Model
Volvo SD 75 B

[tem Make/Model
Takevchi TL12HF
Bradco 105063
Bradco 105067

Edge GA8
Bradco/Paladin 22084
Bradco-HP100

Item Make/Model
RKHL2828
LB35-33CS
LB55-22DC

[tem Make/Model
CASE 621G

John Deere 624K
CASE 1021G

Company

Cowin Equipment
Cowin Equipment
Cowin Equipment

Company

Cowin Equipment

Company
Cowin Equipment

Cowin Equipment
Cowin Equipment
Cowin Equipment
Cowin Equipment
Cowin Equipment

Company
Kenworth of Montgomery, Inc.

Gulf Coast Truck & Equipment
Gulf City Body & Trailer Works

Company

Cowin Equipment
Warrior Tractor & Equipment
Cowin Equipment



Herbicides & Adjuvants

Product

Item 1 — Request

Item 2 — Sulfomet Extra
Item 3 — Capstone

Item 3 — Capstone

Item 4 — Outrider

Item 5 - Element 3 A

Item 6 — Accord

Item 6 — Accord

Item 7 — Red River GP90
Item 8 —- MSMA Plus

Item 9 — Red River 1% Solution
Item 10 — Red River GP 90
Item 11 — Ad-Spray 80
Item 12 — Secure Ultra
Item 13 - GLY Star Pro/Glyphos Extra
Item 14 — Tordon 101

ltem 15 - DMA 4 IVM

Item 16 — Imazapyr 2 SL
Item 17— Krenite S

Item 18 — Diuron 4L

Item 19 — Landmark XP
Item 20 — Roundup Pro/Accord XRT
Item 21 — Plateau

Item 22 — Milestone

Item 22 — Milestone

Item 22 — Milestone

Item 23 — Mojave 70 E G
Item 24 — Ground Zero
Item 25 — Vista XRT

Item 26 — Journey

Item 27 — Hardball

Item 28 — AccuQuest

Item 29 — Brush Rhap

Bid Price
$14.54 gal
$27.29 Ib.
$38.00 gal
$38.00 gal
$13.90 dry oz
$32.94 gal
$17.47 gal (2x2.5)
$17.20 gal (4x30)
$18.90 gal
$21.46 gal
$8.90 gal
$7.49 gal
$7.49 gal
$8.15 qtr.
$13.05 gal
$35.90 gal.
$12.54 gal
$46.50 gal
$63.29 gal
$17.44 gal
$108.00 Ib.
$17.24 gal
$112.50 gal
$309.00 gal
$309.00 gal
$309.00 gal
$8.44 Ib.
$8.50 pt.
$175.00 gal
NO BID
$29.38 gal
$28.10 gal
$74.36 gal

Company
Helena Chemical

Red River Specialties

VM Distributions

Red River Specialties
Helena Chemical

Helena Chemical

Helena Chemical

Helena Chemical

Helena Chemical

Helena Chemical

Red River Specialties
Red River Specialties
Red River Specialties
Crop Production Services
Crop Production Services
Crop Production Services
Red River Specialties
Helena Chemical

Red River Specialties

VM Distribution

Crop Production Services
Red River Specialties
Crop Productions Services
VM Distribution

Red River Specialties
Helena Chemical

Red River Specialties
Red River Specialties
Red River Specialties

Helena Chemical
Helena Chemical
Helena Chemical



Item 30 — Showdown
Item 31 — Barrage HF
Item 32 — Opensight
Item 32 — Opensight
Item 32 — Opensight
Item 32 — Opensight
Item 33 — Tycera

Item 34 — Dyne-A-Pak
Item 35 — Sulfomet XP
Item 36 — Polaris SP
Item 37 — Perspective
Item 38 — Vastlan

Corrugated Metal Pipe

Product

Item 1 — Round Galvanized Metal Plain Pipe
Item 2 — Round Galvanized Metal Pipe Full
Item 3 — Round Galvanized Pipe Polymeric
Item 4 — Round Aluminized Metal Pipe

Item 5 — Arched Galvanized Metal Plain Pipe
Item 6 — Arched Galvanized Metal Pipe Full
Item 7 — Arched Galvanized Pipe Polymeric
Item 8 — Arched Aluminized Metal Pipe

Item 9 — Round Galvanized Metal Plain Pipe
Item 10 — Round Galvanized Metal Pipe Full
Item 11 — Round Galvanized Pipe Polymeric
Item 12 — Round Aluminized Metal Pipe

Item 13 — Arched Galvanized Metal Plain
Item 14 — Arched Galvanized Metal Pipe Full
Item 15 — Arched Galvanized Pipe Polymeric
Item 16 — Arched Aluminized Metal Pipe

$15.78 gal
$26.00 gal
$82.00 Ib.
$78.00 Ib.
$82.00 Ib.
$82.00 Ib.
$86.21 gal
$37.50 gal
$27.69 Ib.
$52.43 gal.
$82.08 Ib.
$69.50 Ib.

Bid Price
$0.71 Ib.
$1.10 Ib.
$0.91 Ib.
$0.74 Ib.
$0.77 Ib.
$1.18 Ib.
$0.98 Ib.
$0.80 Ib.
$0.85 Ib.
$1.45 Ib.
$1.08 Ib.
$0.88 Ib.
$0.92 Ib.
$1.55 Ib.
$1.16 Ib.
$0.95 Ib.

Helena Chemical

Crop Production Services
VM Distribution

Crop Production Services
Red River Specialties
Helena Chemical

Helena Chemical

Helena Chemical

Red River Specialties
Helena Chemical

Red River Specialties

VM Distributions

Company

Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions
Contech Engineered Solutions



Road Signs (Renewed)

Unit Price per Sign

ITEM SIGNS COMPLETE - nit ESELE)TE
NO DESCRIPTION (ALDOT) QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES
1-10 11-25 26+
TYPE Ill 21.38 21.38 21.38 Vulcan Signs
P'fi"é‘gh | TYeEW 21.38 21.38 21.38 Vulcan Signs
s1 Stop Sign, R1-1, 30" x 30" Com f(’ate
Sign TYPE VI 29.15 29.15 29.15 Vulcan Signs
TYPE IX 29.15 29.15 29.15 Vulcan Signs
TYPE llI 30.99 30.99 30.99 Vulcan Signs
Pﬁ"é‘ghp'er TYPE IV 30.99 30.99 30.99 Vulcan Signs
S2 Stop Sign, R1-1, 36" x 36" Combplete
Sign TYPE VI 42.16 42.16 42.16 Vulcan Signs
TYPE IX 42.16 42.16 42.16 Vulcan Signs
TYPE Ill 54.91 54.91 54.91 Vulcan Signs
Pﬁ‘z‘gh o TYPE IV 54.91 54.91 54.91 Vulcan Signs
s3 Stop Sign, R1-1, 48" x 48" Com f(’ate
Sign TYPE VIII 74.77 74.77 74.77 Vulcan Signs
TYPE IX 74.77 74.77 74.77 Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 21.38 21.38 21.38 Osburn
Assoc.,
Each - Osburn
. . : TYPE IV 21.38 21.38 21.38
s4 Advance Traffic Control Sign, W3-1, | Price per Assoc.,
W3-2,W3-3, 30"x 30 Complete |+ pe v 31.75 31.75 31.75 Osburn
Sign Assoc.,
TYPE IX 31.75 31.75 31.75 Osburn

Assoc.,




TYPE I

30.78

30.78

30.78

Osburn

AssocC.,
_ _ Each - TYPE IV 30.78 30.78 30.78 Osburn
S5 Advance Traffic Control Sign, W3-1, | Price per Assoc.,
W3-2, W3-3, 36" x 36 Complete | rype vy 45.72 45.72 45.72 Osburn
Sign Assoc.,
TYPE IX 45.72 45.72 45.72 Osburn
AssocC.,
TYPE Il 10.69 10.69 10.69 Osburn
AssocC.,
PE.aCh - TYPE IV 10.69 10.69 10.69 ggsbgcm
S6 Yield, R1-2, 30" x 30" x 30" Cg;e f’e?; v
P TYPE VIII 15.88 15.88 15.88 sourn
Sign Assoc.,
TYPE IX 15.88 15.88 15.88 Osburn
AssocC.,
TYPE Il 15.39 15.39 15.39 Vulcan Signs
P'fi"é‘gh o TYPE IV 15.39 15.39 15.39 Vulcan Signs
s7 Yield, R1-2, 36" x 36" x 36" Com Ete
Sign TYPE VIII 20.81 20.81 20.81 Vulcan Signs
TYPE IX 20.81 20.81 20.81 Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 27.36 27.36 27.36 Osburn
AssocC.,
PE_aCh - TYPE IV 27.36 2736 27.36 /i’i::é”
S8 Yield, R1-2, 48" x 48" x 48" C(r)lr(;e Eﬁ; v
P TYPE VIII 40.64 40.64 40.64 sourn
Sign Assoc.,
TYPE IX 40.64 40.64 40.64 Osburn
AssocC.,
TYPE Il 30.76 30.76 30.76 Vulcan Signs
PE.aCh - TYPE III 30.76 30.76 30.76 Vulcan Signs
s9 rice per
Highway-Rail Grade Crossing Cog;gr'fte TYPE IV 30.76 30.76 30.76 Vulcan Signs
W10-1, 36" Dia TYPE VIII 41.94 41.94 41.94 Vulcan Signs




TYPE IX 41.94 41.94 41.94 Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 21.97 21.97 21.97 Vulcan Signs
Each - TYPE Il 21.97 21.97 21.97 Vulcan Signs
S10 Highway-Rail Grade Crossing Price per TYPE IV 21.97 21.97 21.97 Vulcan Signs
Complete
W10-1, 30" Dia Sign TYPE VIII 29.72 29.72 29.72 Vulcan Signs
TYPE IX 29.72 29.72 29.72 Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 20.97 20.97 20.97 Vulcan Signs
TYPE llI 20.97 20.97 20.97 Vulcan Signs
Each -
S11 School Advanced Warning Price per TYPE IV 20.97 20.97 20.97 Vulcan Signs
Complete
S1-1, 30" x 30" Sign TYPE VI 28.86 28.86 28.86 Vulcan Signs
F'uorezce”t Y- 28.86 28.86 28.86 Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 30.43 30.43 30.43 Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 30.43 30.43 30.43 Vulcan Signs
Each -
S12 School Advanced Warning Price per TYPE IV 30.43 30.43 30.43 Vulcan Signs
Complete
S1-1, 36" x 36" Sign TYPE VI 41.61 41.61 41.61 Vulcan Signs
F'“Oreé‘:e”t Y- 41.61 41.61 41.61 Vulcan Signs
Each - Osburn
. . . X TYPE Il 1.78 1.78 1.78
s13 ROW sign, white background with Price per Assoc.,
black letters, no border 6" X 12 Corr]plete TYPE Il 178 178 178 Osburn
Sign Assoc.,
Cach TYPE Il 27.36 27.36 27.36 gssst’:é”
Weight limit signs (R12-5 with 6 Prii‘g o Osburm
S14 truck silhouettes; design available Com IF()ate TYPE llI 27.36 27.36 27.36 ASSOC
on request) 24" X 48" Sign b -
TYPE IV 27.36 27.36 27.36 ©Osburn

Assoc.,




TYPE Il

3.42

3.42

3.42

Osburn

Assoc.
. Price per :
All regulatory signs (except R12-5 Osburn
S15 | phelow), MUTCD Chapters 2B & 58 Sg‘cﬂe TYPE I 3.42 3.42 3.42 Assoc.,
TYPE IV 3.42 3.42 3.42 ©Osburn
Assoc.,
TYPE Il 3.42 3.42 3.42 gssst’:é”
All warning signs, MUTCD Chapters | Price per Osbur'r;
S16 | 2C & 5C (except W3-1, W3-2, W3- Square TYPE I 3.42 3.42 3.42
Assoc.,
3) Foot b
TYPE IV 3.42 3.42 3.42 ©Osburn
Assoc.,
TYPE Il 4.67 4.67 4.67 Vulcan Signs
. . . Price per TYPE llI 3.49 3.49 3.49 Vulcan Signs
s17 All construction warning signs, Square
MUTCD Chapters 6F & 5G Foot TYPE IV 3.49 3.49 3.49 Vulcan Signs
Fluorescent 4,78 4.78 4,78 Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 3.49 3.49 3.49 Vulcan Signs
. i TYPE Il 3.49 3.49 3.49 Vul Si
All school signs, MUTCD Chapter Price per tican >igns
S18 7B t S1-1 listed ab Square
(except S1-1 listed above) Foot TYPE IV 3.49 3.49 3.49 Vulcan Signs
F'uorege”t Y- 478 478 478 Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 3.42 3.42 3.42 ©sburn
. . . Assoc.,
All grade crossing signs, MUTCD Price per Osburn
S19 Chapter 8B (Except W10-1 listed Square TYPE llI 3.42 3.42 3.42
Assoc.,
above) Foot osh
TYPE IV 3.42 3.42 3.42 sburn
Assoc.,
TYPE Il 3.49 3.49 3.49 Vulcan Signs
All Guide signs, MUTCD Chapters Price per .
S20 . Square TYPE IlI 3.49 3.49 3.49 Vulcan Signs
2D & 5D Foot
TYPE IV 3.49 3.49 3.49 Vulcan Signs
So1 Hazard Board,"yellcl)lw and black, Price per TYPE Il 3.42 3.42 3.42 Osburn
48"x24 Square Assoc.,




Foot TYPE Il 3.42 3.42 3.42 ©Osburn
Assoc.,
TYPE IV 3.42 3.42 3.42 Osburn
Assoc.,
. , TYPE Il 5.35 5.35 5.35 Vulcan Signs
Street name sign with green or blue Price per
sheeting ON BOTH SIDES, no .
S22 message, 0.100" thick, 9" wide, various Square TYPE I 5.35 5.35 5.35 Vulcan Signs
lengths to be specified at time of order Foot .
TYPE IV 5.35 5.35 5.35 Vulcan Signs
Osburn
Street name signs with green or blue TYPEII 6.29 6.29 6.29 ASSOC
sheeting ON BOTH SIDES, street name, Price per Osb 2
white 6" uppercase w/ 4.5" lowercase letters sburn
S23 ON BOTH SIDES, 0.100" thick, 9" wide, Square TYPE Il 6.29 6.29 6.29 Assoc.,
various lengths to be specified at time of Foot Osburn
order. TYPE IV 6.29 6.29 6.29
Assoc.,
) , TYPE Il 4.82 4.82 4.82 Vulcan Signs
Street name signs with green or blue Price per
sheeting ON BOTH SIDES, no .
S24 message, 0.080" thick, 6 wide, various Square TYPE llI 4.82 4.82 4.82 Vulcan Signs
lengths to be specified at time of order. Foot .
TYPE IV 4.82 4.82 4.82 Vulcan Signs
Street name signs with green or blue TYPE Il 574 5.74 5.74 Osburn
sheeting ON BOTH SIDES, street name, Price per gssboc"
white 4" uppercase w/ 3" lowercase letters sourn
S25 ON BOTH SIDES, 0.080" thick, 6" wide, Square TYPE Il 5.74 5.74 5.74 Assoc.,
various lengths to be specified at time of Foot Osburn
order. TYPE IV 5.74 5.74 5.74 ASSOC
PRICE EACH POST
ITEM
NO SIGN POST UNIT (orders of | (250, 250+
(50 POSTS) | 100, 150, OR | increments
200 POSTS) of 50)
S26 | Sign Post - Green Painted - 2.0 Ib./Ft. - 12 Ft. Each 14.64 14.64 14.64 Vulcan Signs
S27 | Sign Post - Green Painted - 2.0 Ib./Ft. - 10 Ft. Each 12.20 12.20 12.20 Vulcan Signs
S28 Sign Post - Green Painted - 2.0 Ib./Ft. - 8 Ft. Each 9.76 9.76 9.76 Vulcan Signs
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S29 Sigh Post - Galvanized - 3.0 Ib/FT - 10 FT Each 20.99 20.99 20.99 Vulcan Signs
S30 Sigh Post - Galvanized - 3.0 Ib/FT - 12 FT Each 25.19 25.19 25.19 Vulcan Signs
S31 Sigh Post - Galvanized - 3.0 Ib/FT - 14 FT Each 29.39 29.39 29.39 Vulcan Signs
S32 Delineator Post - 1.12 Ib./Ft. - 6 Ft. Each 4.78 4.78 4.78 Vulcan Signs
PRICE PRICE
EACH EACH
lL%M STREETB%AA%EEMT%UNHNG UNIT BRACKET BRACKET
(50 each (100 each
order) order)
s33 Cross Brackgt, for flat. blade signs, 5 1/4" blade Each 395 395 Osburn
holder, with cadmium plated set screws Assoc.,
Caps for U-Channel posts, street name sign
parallel with U-channel mounting surface for flat Osburn
S34 blade signs, 5 1/4" blade holder with cadmium Each 215 2.75 Assoc.,
plated set screws
Caps for U-Channel posts, street name sign
perpendicular to U-channel mounting surface Osburn
S35 for flat blade signs, 5 1/4" blade holder with Each 275 2.75 Assoc.,
cadmium plated set screws
ITEM SHEET
ROLL GOODS UNIT GRADE PRIRC(IDELTER
NO (ALDOT)
| TYPE Il 78.00 ©sburn
Sheeting, 6"x50 yard roll on 3” Assoc.,
diameter core, pressure sensitive, PER Osburn
S36 ALL available colors (except ROLL TYPE I 78.00 Assoc.,
Fluorescent
) TYPE IV 78.00 Osburn
Assoc.,
Sheeting, 9"x50 yard roll on 3" TYPE Il 117.00 Osburn
S37 diameter core, pressure sensitive, PER ] Assoc.,
ALL available colors (except ROLL Osburn
Fluorescent) TYPEII 117.00 Assoc.,

11



TYPE IV

117.00

Osburn

Assoc.,

_ TYPE Il 156.00 ©sburn

Sheeting, 12"x50 yard roll on 3” Assoc.,

diameter core, pressure sensitive, PER Osburn

S38 ALL available colors (except ROLL TYPEI 156.00 Assoc.,
Fluorescent

) TYPE IV 156.00 ©sburn

Assoc.,

_ TYPE Il 234.00 ©sburn

Sheeting, 18”x50 yard roll on 3” Assoc.,

diameter core, pressure sensitive, PER Osburn

S39 ALL available colors (except ROLL TYPEII 234.00 Assoc.,
Fluorescent

) TYPE IV 234.00 ©Osburn

Assoc.,

_ TYPE Il 312.00 ©sburn

Sheeting, 24"x50 yard roll on 3" Assoc.,

diameter core, pressure sensitive, PER Osburn

S40 ALL available colors (except ROLL TYPE I 312.00 Assoc.,
Fluorescent

) TYPE IV 312.00 ©Osburn

Assoc.,

_ TYPE Ii 390.00 ©sburn

Sheeting, 30"x50 yard roll on 3” Assoc.,

diameter core, pressure sensitive, PER Osburn

S4l ALL available colors (except ROLL TYPEII 390.00 Assoc.,
Fluorescent

) TYPE IV 390.00 ©sburn

Assoc.,

_ TYPE Il 468.00 ©sburn

Sheeting, 36”x50 yard roll on 3” Assoc.,

diameter core, pressure sensitive, PER Osburn

S42 ALL available colors (except ROLL TYPE I 468.00 Assoc.,
Fluorescent

) TYPE IV 468.00 ©Osburn

Assoc.,

_ TYPE Il 624.00 Osburn

Sheeting, 48"x50 yard roll on 3” Assoc.,

diameter core, pressure sensitive, PER Osburn

S43 ALL available colors (except ROLL TYPEI 624.00 Assoc.,
Fluorescent

) TYPE IV 624.00 ©sburn

Assoc.,

12



Osburn

24" x 50 Yard 612.00
Assoc.,
. . " Osb
Sheeting, roll on 3” diameter core, PER 30" x 50 Yard 765.00 Asssgén
S44 pressure sensitive, Fluorescent ROLL Osh "
Yellow-Green 36" x 50 Yard 918.00 sourn
Assoc.,
48"x50 Yard | 1224.00 Osburn
Assoc.,
24" x 50 Yard 612.00 ©sburn
Assoc.,
. . " Osh
Sheeting, roll on 3" diameter core, PER 30" x 50 Yard 765.00 A:s(l;én
S45 pressure sensitive, Fluorescent ROLL Osh n
Yellow 36" x 50 Yard 918.00 Soum
Assoc.,
48"x50 Yard | 1224.00 Osburn
Assoc.,
24" x 50 Yard 612.00 Osburn
Assoc.,
. . " Osh
Sheeting, roll on 3" diameter core, PER 30" x 50 Yard 765.00 A:s(l;én
S46 pressure sensitive, Fluorescent ROLL Osb -
Orange 36" x 50 Yard 918.00 Sbum
Assoc.,
48" x 50 Yard 1224.00 ©sburn
Assoc.,
Low Tack Application Tape 6"x100 PER Osburn
S47 yard roll ROLL N/A 22.50 Assoc.,
ITEM Unit Price per Sq. Ft.
NO Sign Blanks UNIT QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES
1-25 Blanks 26-50 51+ Blanks
Blanks
. : Osburn
S48 | Aluminum Diamond/Square, 0.080 Ga. Sq. Ft. 2.04 2.01 1.98 ASSOC
S49 | Aluminum Rectangular, 0.080 Gage Sq. Ft. 2.04 2.01 1.98 g;bgcm
S50 | Aluminum Circle, 0.080 Gage Sq. Ft. 2.04 2.01 1.98 g:sbgén

13



Osburn
) AssocC.,
S51 | Aluminum Octagon, 0.080 Gage Sq. Ft. 2.04 2.01 1.98
TEM SHEET Unit Price per Face
NO SIGN FACE DESCRIPTION UNIT ((ABES([))E) QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES
1-10 11-25 26+
TYPE Il 8.63 8.63 8.63 Osburn
AssocC.,
Each - TYPE IV 8.63 8.63 8.63 gssst’:é”
S52 Stop Sign Face, R1-1, 30" x 30" Price per Osb -
Face TYPE VIII 15.48 15.48 15.48 sourn
AssocC.,
TYPE IX 15.48 15.48 15.48 Osburn
AssocC.,
TYPE Il 12.42 12.42 12.42 Osburn
AssocC.,
Each - TYPE IV 12.42 12.42 12.42 gssst’:é”
S53 Stop Sign Face, R1-1, 36" x 36" Price per Osb "
Face TYPE VIII 22.32 22.32 22.32 sourn
AssocC.,
TYPE IX 2232 22.32 2232 Osburn
AssocC.,
TYPE Il 22.08 22.08 22.08 Osburn
AssocC.,
Each - TYPE IV 22.08 22.08 22.08 2:;’:;”
S54 Stop Sign Face, R1-1, 48" x 48" Price per Osh n
Face TYPE VIII 39.68 39.68 39.68 sourn
AssocC.,
TYPE IX 39.68 39.68 39.68 Osburn
AssocC.,
TYPE Il 8.63 8.63 8.63 Osburn
Each - AssocC.,
Advance Traffic Control Sign Face, . Osburn
S55 W3l W2 Wa3. 30" x 30" Prllzcaecger TYPE IV 8.63 8.63 8.63 ASs0e.
TYPE VIII 15.48 15.48 15.48 Osburn
AssocC.,
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TYPE IX

15.48

15.48

15.48

Osburn

AssocC.,
TYPE IIl 12.42 12.42 12.42 Osburn
AssocC.,
. . Each - TYPE IV 12.42 12.42 12.42 Osburn
S56 Advance Traffic Control Sign Face, Price per Assoc.,
W3-1, W3-2, W3-3, 36" x 36 Face TYPE VIII 22.32 22.32 22.32 Osburn
AssocC.,
TYPE IX 22.32 22.32 22.32 Osburn
AssocC.,
TYPE Il 431 431 431 Osburn
AssocC.,
Each TYPE IV 431 431 431 Osburn
Yield Sign Face, R1-2, -ach - ' ' ' Assoc.,
Face TYPE VIII 7.75 7.75 7.75 sourn
AssocC.,
TYPE IX 7.75 7.75 7.75 Osburn
AssocC.,
TYPE IIl 6.21 6.21 6.21 Osburn
AssocC.,
Each TYPE IV 6.21 6.21 6.21 Osburn
Yield Sign Face, R1-2, 36"x36" -ach - ' ' ' Assoc.,

S58 ¥36" Price per Osb
Face TYPE VIII 11.16 11.16 11.16 sourn
AssocC.,
TYPE IX 11.16 11.16 11.16 Osburn
AssocC.,
Osburn

TYPE Il 11.04 11.04 11.04
AssocC.,
Osburn
) TYPE IV 11.04 11.04 11.04

Yield Sign Face, R1-2, Each Assoc.,

S99 48"X48"X48" Price per Osh
Face TYPE VIII 19.84 19.84 19.84 sourn
AssocC.,
TYPE IX 19.84 19.84 19.84 Osburn
AssocC.,
TYPE IIl 12.42 12.42 12.42 Osburn
Highway-Rail Grade Crossing Sign Each ] ] ] Assoc.,
S60 Face Price per TYPE IV 12.42 12.42 12.42 Osburn
AssocC.,

Face osb
W10-1, 36" Dia TYPE VIII 22.32 22.32 22.32 sourn
AssoC.,
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TYPE IX

22.32

22.32

22.32

Osburn

Assoc.,
Osburn
TYPE 1l . .6 .
Highway-Rail Grade Crossing Sign 8.63 8.63 8.63 Assoc.,
F
ace Each - TYPE IV 8.63 8.63 8.63 ©sburn
. Assoc.,
S61 Price per Osb
W10-1, 30" Dia Face TYPE VIl 15.48 15.48 15.48 Sbum
Assoc.,
TYPE IX 15.48 15.48 15.48 Osburn
Assoc.,
TYPE 1l 9.31 9.31 9.31 Vulcan Signs
School Advanced Warning Sign | o TYPE IV 9.31 9.31 9.31 Vulcan Signs
Face .
S62 Price per
S1-1, 30" x 30" Face TYPE VI 17.50 17.50 17.50 Vulcan Signs
F'uorezce”t Y- 17.50 17.50 17.50 Vulcan Signs
TYPE 1l 13.41 13.41 13.41 Vulcan Signs
School Advanced Warning Sign Each - TYPE IV 13.41 13.41 13.41 Vulcan Signs
Face .
S63 Price per
S1-1, 36" x 36" Face TYPE VI 25.20 25.20 25.20 Vulcan Signs
F'uorezce”t Y- 25.20 25.20 25.20 Vulcan Signs
Unit Price per Sign Face Sq. Ft.
ITEM SIGN FACES ONLY - UNIT égig};
NO DESCRIPTION (ALDOT) QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES | QUANTITIES
1-10 11-25 26+
, TYPE Il 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
Price per Assoc.,
All regulatory sign faces , MUTCD Face Osburn
S64 Chapters 2B & 5B Square TYPEI 1.38 1.38 1.38 Assoc.,
Foot
TYPE IV 1.38 1.38 1.38 ©sburn
Assoc.,
Price per TYPE I 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
All warning signs, MUTCD Chapters Face ] ) ' Assoc.,
S65 2C & 5C Square Osburn
Foot TYPE llI 1.38 1.38 1.38 Assoc.,
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TYPE IV

1.38

1.38

1.38

Osburn

Assoc.,
TYPE Il 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
Assoc.,
_ o Price per | 1ypg 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
S66 All construction warning signs, Face Assoc.,
MUTCD Chapt 6F & 5G
apters Square TYPE IV 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
Foot Assoc.,
Fluorescent 2.48 2.48 2.48 Osburn
Assoc.,
TYPEII 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
Assoc.,
Price per TYPE Il 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
S67 All school signs, MUTCD Chapter Face ' ) ' Assoc.,
7B (except S1-1 listed above) Square TYPE IV 138 138 138 Osburn
Foot Assoc.,
Fluorescent Y- 248 248 248 Osburn
G AssocC.,
_ TYPE Il 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
: : Price per Assoc.,
All grade crossing signs, MUTCD Face Osburn
S68 Chapter 8B (Except W10-1 listed TYPE 1l 1.38 1.38 1.38
Square Assoc.,
above) Foot Osb
TYPE IV 1.38 1.38 1.38 sourn
Assoc.,
, TYPEII 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
Price per Assoc.,
All Guide signs, MUTCD Chapters Face Osburn
S69 2D & 5D Square TYPE Il 1.38 1.38 1.38 Assoc.,
Foot
TYPE IV 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
Assoc.,
TYPEII 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
Assoc.,
. TYPE Il 1.38 1.38 1.38 Osburn
Price per Assoc.,
s70 Hazard Board, yellow and black, Face Osburn
48"x24" Square Assoc.,
Foot TYPE IV 1.38 1.38 1.38
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Price per Packet of 25 of same Letter/No.

ITEM Pressure Sensitive Cut SHEET
NO Upper/Lower Letters and UNIT GRADE
Numbers (ALDOT) Series B Series D Series E(M)
Pack of . .
S71 | 2. Inch Cut Letters and Numbers o5 Black 1.94 2.57 No Bid Vulcan Signs
Pack of . .
S72 | 3.Inch Cut Letters and Numbers o5 Black 2.57 2.80 No Bid Vulcan Signs
Pack of :
S73 | 5Inch Cut Letters and Numbers o5 Black 3.92 5.03 6.06 Vulcan Signs
Pack of .
S74 | 8 Inch Cut Letters and Numbers o5 Black 7.04 9.84 12.62 Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 2.25 4.30 No Bid Vulcan Signs
s75 | 21nch White Reflective Cut | Pack of TYPE Il 2.25 430 NoBid | Vulcan Signs
Letters and Numbers 25
TYPE IV 2.25 4.30 No Bid Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 4.30 4.99 No Bid Vulcan Signs
s7e | 31nch White Reflective Cut | Pack of TYPE Il 4.30 4.99 NoBid | Vulcan Signs
Letters and Numbers 25
TYPE IV 4.30 4.99 No Bid Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 8.66 No Bid No Bid Vulcan Signs
s77 | 4:21nch White Reflective Cut | Pack of TYPE Il 8.66 No Bid No Bid Vulcan Signs
Letters and Numbers 25
TYPE IV 8.66 No Bid No Bid Vulcan Signs
TYPE Il 8.08 11.65 14.95 Vulcan Signs
s7g | 21nch White Reflective Cut Pack of TYPE Il 8.08 11.65 14.95 Vulcan Signs
Letters and Numbers 25
TYPE IV 8.08 11.65 14.95 Vulcan Signs
<70 6 Inch White Reflective cut Pack of TYPE Il 11.28 16.03 20.79 Vulcan Signs
Letters and Numbers 25 TYPE Il 11.28 16.03 20.79 Vulcan Signs
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TYPE IV 11.28 16.03 20.79 Vulcan Signs

TYPE Il 18.12 27.11 32.69 Vulcan Signs

sgo | 81nch White Reflective Cut Pack of TYPE Il 18.12 27.11 32.69 Vulcan Signs
Letters and Numbers 25

TYPE IV 18.12 27.11 32.69 Vulcan Signs
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