

ALL 67 COUNTIES ARE ELIGIBLE TO PURCHASE

TRAFFIC MARKING MATERIALS BID TABULATIONS

										OZARK MATERIALS, LLC	ENNIS-FLINT, INC.	SAFETY COATINGS, INC.
Thermoplastic Preformed												
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 6" X 3' White Line, 125 mil, 20 Per Pack												
Delivered	\$	/PKG								\$92.24	\$52.92	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 6" X 3' Yellow Line, 125 mil, 20 Per Pack												
Delivered	\$	/PKG								\$102.44	\$52.92	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 12" X 3' White Line, 125 mil, 10 Per Pack												
Delivered	\$	/PKG								\$97.24	\$52.92	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 12" X 3' Yellow Line, 125 mil, 10 Per Pack												
Delivered	\$	/PKG								\$102.44	\$52.92	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 24" X 3' White Line, 125 mil, 5 Per Pack												
Delivered	\$	/PKG								\$97.24	\$52.92	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 24" X 3' Yellow Line, 125 mil, 5 Per Pack												
Delivered	\$	/PKG								\$102.44	\$52.92	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 48" X 48" White on Blue Handicap Symbol, 125 mil, 2 Per Pack												
Delivered	\$	/PKG								\$213.20	\$115.89	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 24" X 36" Yield Line (Shark's Teeth), 125 mil, 10 Per Pack												
Delivered	\$	/PKG								\$124.80	\$71.47	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 8' 2" X 6' 3" Turn Arrow Standard Rev, 125 mil, 2 Per Pack												
Delivered	\$	/PKG								\$201.76	\$116.30	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 8' 2" X 6' 3" Turn Arrow Standard Left, 125 mil, 2 Per Pack												
Delivered	\$	/PKG								\$201.76	\$116.30	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 8' 2" X 6' 3" Turn Arrow Standard Right, 125 mil, 2 Per Pack												
Delivered	\$	/PKG								\$201.76	\$116.30	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 13' 1" X 7' 4" Combo Arrow Standard Rev, 125 mil												
Delivered	\$	/Each								\$183.04	\$105.18	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 13' 1" X 7' 4" Combo Arrow Standard Left, 125 mil												
Delivered	\$	/Each								\$183.04	\$105.18	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 13' 1" X 7' 4" Combo Arrow Standard Right, 125 mil												
Delivered	\$	/Each								\$183.04	\$105.18	NO BID
Marking Compound, Class 2, Thermoplastic, Preformed 8' ONLY, 125 mil												

