

2021 ACCA LIQUID ASPHALT BID TABULATIONS

Note: Ergon did not add their \$400 drop tanker fee in items 5&6. \$250 per trailer swap out.

Note: Ergon \$400 drop tanker fee converted to price per gal. based on 5600 gal. is \$0.0714

					\$.0714 per gal.	
					Drop Tanker Fee	
					Added to Item 5&6	
		CLEAR LOW BIDS				
		HUNT	ERGON	ERGON	HUDSON	
Autauga County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid	
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid	
	ITEM 3	\$1.6287	\$1.7600		No Bid	
	ITEM 4	\$1.9266	\$2.0600		No Bid	
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7600	\$1.8314	No Bid	
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0600	\$2.1314	No Bid	
Baldwin County	ITEM 1	\$1.5957	\$1.6000		No Bid	
	ITEM 2	\$1.8936	\$1.9000		No Bid	
	ITEM 3	\$1.8628	\$1.7900		No Bid	
	ITEM 4	\$2.1607	\$2.0900		No Bid	
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7900	\$1.8614	No Bid	
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0900	\$2.1614	No Bid	

Barbour County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6944	\$1.8100		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9923	\$2.1100		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8100	\$1.8814	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1100	\$2.1814	No Bid
Bibb County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.5963	\$1.7400		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.8942	\$2.0400		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7400	\$1.8114	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0400	\$2.1114	No Bid
Blount County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.5000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6496	\$1.6000		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9475	\$1.8800		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6000	\$1.6714	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.8800	\$1.9514	No Bid
Bullock County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid

	ITEM 3	\$1.6596	\$1.7900		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9475	\$2.0900		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7900	\$1.8614	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0900	\$2.1614	No Bid
Butler County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6700	\$1.7900		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9645	\$2.0900		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7900	\$1.8614	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0900	\$2.1614	No Bid
Calhoun County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		\$1.8830
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		\$2.2605
	ITEM 3	\$1.6993	\$1.7600		\$2.0242
	ITEM 4	\$1.9843	\$2.0600		\$2.4017
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7600	\$1.8314	\$2.1090
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0600	\$2.1314	\$2.4865
Chambers County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.5000		No Bid

	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6915	\$1.6300		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9894	\$1.9100		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6300	\$1.7014	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.9100	\$1.9814	No Bid
Cherokee County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.5000		\$1.7330
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		\$2.1605
	ITEM 3	\$1.6859	\$1.6200		\$1.8268
	ITEM 4	\$1.9838	\$1.9000		\$2.2543
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6200	\$1.6914	\$1.8811
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.9000	\$1.9714	\$2.3086
Chilton County	ITEM 1	\$1.4468	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6180	\$1.7500		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9372	\$2.1500		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7500	\$1.8214	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1500	\$2.2214	No Bid
Choctaw County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid

	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6608	\$1.7900		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9587	\$2.0900		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7900	\$1.8614	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0900	\$2.1614	No Bid
Clarke County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6700	\$1.7900		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9700	\$2.0900		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7900	\$1.8614	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0900	\$2.1614	No Bid
Clay County	ITEM 1	\$1.4340	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6102	\$1.7700		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9422	\$2.0700		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7700	\$1.8414	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0700	\$2.1414	No Bid
Cleburne County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.5000		\$1.8830
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		\$2.2605
	ITEM 3	\$1.6803	\$1.6100		\$2.0205

	ITEM 4	\$1.9782	\$1.8900		\$2.3980
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6100	\$1.6814	\$2.1094
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.8900	\$1.9614	\$2.4869
Coffee County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6809	\$1.8200		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9788	\$2.1200		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8200	\$1.8914	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1200	\$2.1914	No Bid
Colbert County	ITEM 1	\$1.4575	\$1.5000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6175	\$1.6100		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9260	\$1.8900		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6100	\$1.6814	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.8900	\$1.9614	No Bid
Conecuh County	ITEM 1	\$1.4362	\$1.6000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7447	\$1.9000		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6607	\$1.8000		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9692	\$2.1000		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8000	\$1.8714	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1000	\$2.1714	No Bid

Coosa County	ITEM 1	\$1.4468	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6244	\$1.7600		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9436	\$2.0600		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7600	\$1.8314	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0600	\$2.1314	No Bid
Covington County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9000		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6922	\$1.8100		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$2.0000	\$2.1100		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8100	\$1.8814	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1100	\$2.1814	No Bid
Crenshaw County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6841	\$1.8500		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9820	\$2.1500		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8500	\$1.9214	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1500	\$2.2214	No Bid

Cullman County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.5000		\$1.8830
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		\$2.2605
	ITEM 3	\$1.6435	\$1.5900		\$2.0411
	ITEM 4	\$1.9414	\$1.8700		\$2.4186
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.5900	\$1.6614	\$2.1361
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.8700	\$1.9414	\$2.5136
Dale County	ITEM 1	\$1.4362	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6897	\$1.8100		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$2.0200	\$2.1100		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8100	\$1.8814	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1100	\$2.1814	No Bid
Dallas County	ITEM 1	\$1.4575	\$1.6000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9000		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6176	\$1.7200		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9261	\$2.0200		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7200	\$1.7914	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0200	\$2.0914	No Bid

DeKalb County	ITEM 1	\$1.4255	\$1.5000		\$1.7330
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		\$2.1605
	ITEM 3	\$1.6807	\$1.6100		\$1.8041
	ITEM 4	\$2.0220	\$1.8900		\$2.2316
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6100	\$1.6814	\$1.8469
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.8900	\$1.9614	\$2.2744
Elmore County	ITEM 1	\$1.4468	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7447	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6388	\$1.7700		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9367	\$2.0700		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7700	\$1.8414	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0700	\$2.1414	No Bid
Escambia County	ITEM 1	\$1.5900	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.8936	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.8350	\$1.8500		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$2.1386	\$2.1500		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8500	\$1.9214	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1500	\$2.2214	No Bid
Etowah County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6000		\$1.8830
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9000		\$2.2605

	ITEM 3	\$1.6943	\$1.7100		\$1.9896
	ITEM 4	\$1.9922	\$2.0100		\$2.3671
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7100	\$1.7814	\$2.0602
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0100	\$2.0814	\$2.4377
Fayette County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6074	\$1.7500		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9053	\$2.0500		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7500	\$1.8214	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0500	\$2.1214	No Bid
Franklin County	ITEM 1	\$1.4362	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.5942	\$1.7600		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9240	\$2.0600		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7600	\$1.8314	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0600	\$2.1314	No Bid
Geneva County	ITEM 1	\$1.4894	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.7647	\$1.8600		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$2.0413	\$2.1600		No Bid

	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8600	\$1.9314	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1600	\$2.2314	No Bid
Greene County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.5954	\$1.7600		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.8933	\$2.0600		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7600	\$1.8314	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0600	\$2.1314	No Bid
Hale County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6284	\$1.7600		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9263	\$2.0600		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7600	\$1.8314	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0600	\$2.1314	No Bid
Henry County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.7154	\$1.8500		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$2.0133	\$2.1500		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8500	\$1.9214	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1500	\$2.2214	No Bid

Houston County	ITEM 1	\$1.4553	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6698	\$1.8600		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9805	\$2.1600		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8600	\$1.9314	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1600	\$2.2314	No Bid
Jackson County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.5000		\$1.7330
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		\$2.1605
	ITEM 3	\$1.7710	\$1.6200		\$1.8151
	ITEM 4	\$2.0689	\$1.9000		\$2.2426
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6200	\$1.6914	\$1.8653
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.9000	\$1.9714	\$2.2928
Jefferson County	ITEM 1	\$1.4894	\$1.5000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.7241	\$1.5700		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$2.0000	\$1.8500		No Bid

	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.5700	\$1.6414	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.8500	\$1.9214	No Bid
Lamar County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6089	\$1.7600		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9068	\$2.0600		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7600	\$1.8314	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0600	\$2.1314	No Bid
Lauderdale County	ITEM 1	\$1.4617	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7574	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6173	\$1.7700		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9130	\$2.0700		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7700	\$1.8414	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0700	\$2.1414	No Bid
Lawrence County	ITEM 1	\$1.4170	\$1.5000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7149	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.5600	\$1.6100		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.8600	\$1.8900		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6100	\$1.6814	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.8900	\$1.9614	No Bid

Lee County	ITEM 1	\$1.4550	\$1.5000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6750	\$1.6300		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9860	\$1.9100		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6300	\$1.7014	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.9100	\$1.9814	No Bid
Limestone County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.5000		\$1.8830
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		\$2.2605
	ITEM 3	\$1.6791	\$1.6200		\$2.0524
	ITEM 4	\$1.9770	\$1.9000		\$2.4299
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6200	\$1.6914	\$2.1542
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.9000	\$1.9714	\$2.5317
Lowndes County	ITEM 1	\$1.4362	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7234	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6109	\$1.8200		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.8983	\$2.1200		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8200	\$1.8914	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1200	\$2.1914	No Bid

Macon County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6769	\$1.7900		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9748	\$2.0900		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7900	\$1.8614	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0900	\$2.1614	No Bid
Madison County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6000		\$1.7830
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9000		\$2.1605
	ITEM 3	\$1.6769	\$1.7300		\$1.9018
	ITEM 4	\$1.9748	\$2.0300		\$2.2793
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7300	\$1.8014	\$1.9765
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0300	\$2.1014	\$2.3540
Marengo County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6258	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9237	\$2.0800		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7800	\$1.8514	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0800	\$2.1514	No Bid

Marion County	ITEM 1	\$1.4595	\$1.5000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6323	\$1.6000		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9390	\$1.8800		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6000	\$1.6714	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.8800	\$1.9514	No Bid
Marshall County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		\$1.7330
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		\$2.1605
	ITEM 3	\$1.6781	\$1.7600		\$1.8437
	ITEM 4	\$1.9760	\$2.0600		\$2.2712
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7600	\$1.8314	\$1.9102
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0600	\$2.1314	\$2.3377
Mobile County	NO BID	\$1.5957	\$1.6500		No Bid
	NO BID	\$1.8936	\$1.9500		No Bid
	NO BID	\$1.8173	\$1.8700		No Bid
	NO BID	\$2.1152	\$2.1700		No Bid
	NO BID	NB	\$1.8700	\$1.9414	No Bid
	NO BID	NB	\$2.1700	\$2.2414	No Bid
Monroe County	ITEM 1	\$1.4255	\$1.6000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9000		No Bid

	ITEM 3	\$1.6936	\$1.8000		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$2.0341	\$2.1000		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8000	\$1.8714	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1000	\$2.1714	No Bid
Montgomery County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9000		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6614	\$1.7300		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9593	\$2.0300		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7300	\$1.8014	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0300	\$2.1014	No Bid
Morgan County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.5000		\$1.8830
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		\$2.2605
	ITEM 3	\$1.6456	\$1.6100		\$2.0581
	ITEM 4	\$1.9593	\$1.8900		\$2.4356
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6100	\$1.6814	\$2.1632
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.8900	\$1.9614	\$2.5407
Perry County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6159	\$1.7500		No Bid

	ITEM 4	\$1.9138	\$2.0500		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7500	\$1.8214	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0500	\$2.1214	No Bid
Pickens County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.5963	\$1.7700		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.8942	\$2.0700		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7700	\$1.8414	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0700	\$2.1414	No Bid
Pike County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6859	\$1.7900		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9838	\$2.0900		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7900	\$1.8614	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0900	\$2.1614	No Bid
Randolph County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid

	ITEM 3	\$1.6914	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9893	\$2.0800		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7800	\$1.8514	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0800	\$2.1514	No Bid
Russell County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.5000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.7085	\$1.6600		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$2.0064	\$1.9400		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6600	\$1.7314	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.9400	\$2.0114	No Bid
St. Clair County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.5000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6579	\$1.6000		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9498	\$1.8800		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.6000	\$1.6714	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.8800	\$1.9514	No Bid
Shelby County	ITEM 1	\$1.4595	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6004	\$1.7400		No Bid

	ITEM 4	\$1.9069	\$2.0400		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7400	\$1.8114	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0400	\$2.1114	No Bid
Sumter County	ITEM 1	\$1.4500	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6010	\$1.7700		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9163	\$2.0700		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7700	\$1.8414	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0700	\$2.1414	No Bid
Talladega County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9000		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6532	\$1.7100		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9571	\$2.0100		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7100	\$1.7814	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0100	\$2.0814	No Bid
Tallapoosa County	ITEM 1	\$1.4340	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6340	\$1.7700		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9660	\$2.0700		No Bid

	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7700	\$1.8414	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0700	\$2.1414	No Bid
Tuscaloosa County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.5718	\$1.7500		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.8697	\$2.0500		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7500	\$1.8214	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0500	\$2.1214	No Bid
Walker County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.5000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.7800		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6149	\$1.5800		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9128	\$1.8600		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.5800	\$1.6514	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$1.8600	\$1.9314	No Bid
Washington County	ITEM 1	\$1.5106	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.7284	\$1.8500		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9838	\$2.1500		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.8500	\$1.9214	No Bid

	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.1500	\$2.2214	No Bid
Wilcox County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6000		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9000		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6519	\$1.7300		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9498	\$2.0300		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7300	\$1.8014	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0300	\$2.1014	No Bid
Winston County	ITEM 1	\$1.4681	\$1.6500		No Bid
	ITEM 2	\$1.7660	\$1.9500		No Bid
	ITEM 3	\$1.6519	\$1.7400		No Bid
	ITEM 4	\$1.9498	\$2.0400		No Bid
	ITEM 5	NB	\$1.7400	\$1.8114	No Bid
	ITEM 6	NB	\$2.0400	\$2.1114	No Bid