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Heavy Equipment Item Make/Model Company
Award 

Recommendations

Asphalt Milling Attachments:
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option A-30 inch 300X Asphalt Zipper $146,485.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option A-42 inch 420X Asphalt Zipper $159,855.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option B-36 inch 360X Asphalt Zipper $151,270.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option B-48 inch 480X Asphalt Zipper $183,560.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option C-48 inch 480Xi Asphalt Zipper $212,625.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option C-72 Inch 720Xi Asphalt Zipper $257,530.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option D-96 Inch 960Xi Asphalt Zipper $275,455.00

Skid Steer Loader and Attachments:
Skid Steer Loader with No Attachments Takeuchi TL12V2 Cowin Equipment Co. $83,121.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 1:  Smooth Drum Vibratory Roller No Bid

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 2:  Pad Foot Vibratory Roller No Bid

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 3: Grader Blade No Bid

2023 County Joint Bid Program Price List

Note: Red letter items were renewed for 2023
Old Format Items:  Dump Bodies, Heavy Duty Dump Chassis, Lowboy Tractors



Skid Steer Loader Attachment 4: Angle Broom No Bid

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 5: Cold Planer No Bid

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 6: Road Widener Single Discharge Road Widener Single Thompson Tractor Co. $67,064.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 7: Road Widener Dual Discharge Road Widener Dual Thompson Tractor Co. $77,920.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 8: Mulcher No Bid

Backhoes:
Light Duty CAT 416 Thompson Tractor Co. $104,243.00

Medium Duty Deere 320P Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $119,566.00

Heavy Duty-Option A CAT 430 Thompson Tractor Co. $134,820.00

Heavy Duty-Option C Deere 320P Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $121,922.00

Tractors
85 PTO - Option A No Bid

85 PTO - Option B No Bid

95PTO - Option A No Bid

95 PTO - Option B No Bid

Track Mount Excavator - Option A-1 Deere 300P Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $328,755.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option A-2 Volvo EC300E Cowin Equipment Co. $247,487.00



Track Mount Excavator - Option A-3 CAT 330 Thompson Tractor Co. $354,125.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option B-1 No Award

Track Mount Excavator - Option B-2 Deere 210P Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $242,090.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option B-3 Komatsu PC210LC-11 Tractor & Equipment Co. $254,800.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option C-1 Volvo EC160E Cowin Equipment Co. $165,707.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option C-2 Deere 160P Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $221,357.00

21 Ton Wheeled Excavator CAT M320 Thompson Tractor Co. $347,401.00

19 Ton Wheeled Excavator Volvo EWR170E Cowin Equipment Co. $253,274.00

Highway Speed Truck Mounted Excavator
2 Wheel Drive No Bid

4 Wheel Drive No Bid

Compact Track Excavators
Compact Track Excavator - Option D-1 Volvo ECR88D Cowin Equipment Co. $113,976.00

Compact Track Excavator - Option D-2 CAT 309 Thompson Tractor Co. $148,170.00

Compact Track Excavator - Option D-3 Takeuchi TB290 Cowin Equipment Co. $108,001.00

Mini Track Excavator - Option E-1 Takeuchi TB240 Cowin Equipment Co. $57,035.00



Motorgraders:
Heavy Duty Motor Grader - Option A CAT 150 Thompson Tractor Co. $379,998.00

Heavy Duty Motor Grader - Option B CAT 140-Steering Wheel Thompson Tractor Co. $336,400.00

Medium Duty Motor Grader - Option A Komatsu GD655-6 Tractor & Equipment Co. $354,800.00

Medium Duty Motor Grader - Option B CAT 140-Joystick Thompson Tractor Co. $342,477.00

Medium Duty Motor Grader - AWD Deere 672G Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $383,659.00

Light Duty Motor Grader - Option A CAT 120-Joystick Thompson Tractor Co. $321,225.00

Light Duty Motor Grader - Option B Deere 670G Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $348,433.00

Pothole Patchers:
One Man Pothole Patcher - Option A Rosco RA400 Tractor & Equipment Co. $293,700.00

One Man Pothole Patcher - Option B DuraPatcher P-5 Coblentz Equipment & Parts $267,305.00

Trailer Mount Patcher - Diesel Option P-2 Diesel Coblentz Equipment & Parts $87,777.00

Trailer Mount Patcher - Air Compressor/Tools Vortex Warren Power Attachments $82,658.75

Trailer Mount Mastic Patcher/Crack Sealer No Bid

Asphalt Storage Tank 3000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $47,035.30

4000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $49,284.40

5000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $55,731.25



6000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $55,901.22

7000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $59,327.15

8000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $63,049.30

9000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $75,211.53

10000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $75,647.15

Dozers
100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option A No Award

100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option B CAT D3 Thompson Tractor Co. $198,531.00

100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option C Deere 650P Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $191,901.00

100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option D Komatsu D39PX-24 Tractor & Equipment Co. $187,200.00

130 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option A Deere 700L Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $222,508.00

130 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option B CAT D4 Thompson Tractor Co. $249,017.00

Mulching Dozer CAT D1 Mulching Thompson Tractor Co. $255,987.00

Half Round End Dump
28 FT. Half Round End Dump MANAC 4H228AB00 Gulf City Body & Trailer $66,370.00

Lowboy Trailer
35 Ton Lowboy Trailer Pitts LB35-33CS Gulf City Body & Trailer $50,919.00



55 Ton Lowboy Trailer Pitts LB55-22DC Gulf City Body & Trailer $78,573.00

Wheel Loaders:
3 CY-Option A CAT 930M Thompson Tractor Co. $250,827.00

3 CY-Option B Deere 544P Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $233,694.00

3 CY-Option C Volvo L70H Cowin Equipment Co. $179,867.00

3.65 CY-Option A CAT 938M Thompson Tractor Co. $280,949.00

3.65 CY-Option B Deere 624P Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $263,297.00

Dump Bodies - Old Format
16' Steel Dump Body-Option B (Manual) 16 FT.  LE 21 CY Logan Cross Corporation $40,200.00
16' Steel Dump Body-Option B (Automatic) 16 FT.  LE 21 CY Logan Cross Corporation $41,110.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option D (Manual) WAR-16 Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc. $42,500.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option D (Automatic) WAR-16 Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc. $43,220.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option E (Manual) 16 FT. Maverick 21 CY Childersburg Truck Services $45,669.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option E (Automatic) 16 FT. Maverick 21 CY Childersburg Truck Services $46,251.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option F (Manual) Warren WXL-16 Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc. $40,100.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option F (Automatic) Warren WXL-16 Warren Truck & Trailer, Inc. $40,820.00

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis - Old Format
Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option A Mack Granite 64FR Nextran Truck Centers $172,586.00

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option B No Bid

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option C Kenworth T880/T880S Kenworth of Birmingham $213,500.00

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option D No Bid



Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option F International HX620 Southland Transportation Group $170,389.43

Lowboy Tractor:  Old Format
Lowboy Tractor-Option A Mack Pinnacle 64T Nextran Truck Centers $178,078.00

Lowboy Tractor-Option B Kenworth T880/T880S Kenworth of Birmingham $208,500.00

Lowboy Tractor-Option E International HX520 Southland Transportation Group $176,184.41

Road Widener:
6 FT. Road Widener Midland SPR-6 Pittman Tractor Co. $173,821.60
8 FT. Road Widener Midland SPD-8 Pittman Tractor Co. $258,028.00
Road Widener Attachment - Option A Midland WA Pittman Tractor Co. $156,181.60
Road Widener Attachment - Option B Midland SA Pittman Tractor Co. $124,328.80

Rollers
Rubber Tire Roller Hamm HP180i Tractor & Equipment Co. $152,000.00
7.5 Ton Single Drum Vibratory Roller Volvo SD75B Cowin Equipment Co. $110,694.00

Ride-On Industrial Boom Mower-Option A
22 FT. Reach MowerMax Coblentz Equipment & Parts $242,054.70
24 FT. Reach MowerMax Coblentz Equipment & Parts $242,054.70
26 FT. Reach MowerMax Coblentz Equipment & Parts $245,660.70
30 FT. Reach MowerMax Coblentz Equipment & Parts $251,194.70

Ride-On Industrial Boom Mower-Option B
21 FT. Reach Aspen Fast 6 Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $209,840.00
24 FT. Reach Aspen Fast 7 Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $214,800.00
30 FT. Reach Aspen Fast 9 Warrior Tractor & Equipment Co. $227,602.00



Ride-On Industrial Boom Mower-Option C No Bid

Aspahlt Distributor Truck Etnyre Centennial Cowin Equipment Co. $274,095.00

Chip Spreader Etnyre CS 9-18 Cowin Equipment Co. $389,857.00


	Revised for Attchmt.



