CORRUGATED METAL CULVERT PIPE - PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT
(ACCA JOINT BID PROGRAM - 2022)
CONTRACT PERIOD 10/01/2022 - 9/30/2023

. Regions: Counties
East Central Blount » Calhoun  Chambers ¢ Clay « Cleburne » Coosa « Jefferson » Randolph * Shelby « St. Clair » Talladega * Tallapoosa
North Cherokee ¢ Cullman « Colbert « Dekalb « Etowah Franklin « Jackson ¢ Lauderdale « Lawrence « Limestone ¢« Madison ¢ Marshall « Morgan
Autauga * Barbour ¢ Bullock « Butler « Coffee ¢« Covington « Crenshaw « Dale ¢ Dallas * Elmore
Southeast Geneva ¢« Henry * Houston ¢ Lee « Lowndes * Macon ¢ Montgomery ¢ Pike ¢ Russell
Southwest Baldwin  Conecuh « Escambia « Mobile « Clarke » Choctaw « Marengo « Monroe « Washington » Wilcox

West Central

Bibb ¢ Chilton « Fayette « Greene « Hale « Lamar * Marion * Perry « Pickens ¢« Sumter « Tuscaloosa * Walker « Winston




2022-2023 ACCA METAL PIPE BID TABULATIONS

PICKED UP AT THE PLANT - EAST CENTRAL REGION
| | | CONTECH | GULF ATLANTIC* | LOW BID | AWARDED TO | Twin Oaks
ITEM 1 Round Galvanized Metal Plain Pipe $1.67 $2.10 $1.67 CONTECH $2.30
ITEM2  [Round Galvanized Pipe Polymeric Coating $2.29 No Bid $2.29 CONTECH No Bid
ITEM 3 Round Aluminized Metal Pipe $1.83 $2.25 $1.83 CONTECH $2.41
ITEM4  [Arched Galvanized Metal Plain Pipe $1.79 $2.24 $1.79 CONTECH $2.46
ITEM5  |Arched Galvanized Pipe Polymeric Coating $2.46 No Bid $2.46 CONTECH No Bid
ITEM6  [Arched Aluminized Metal Pipe $1.97 $2.39 $1.97 CONTECH $2.58
Option Cost Sheet for Corrugated Metal Pipe Option Price
Options: Contech Gulf Atlantic
Sloped ends, cutting pipe will be an additional per foot price 3 x Diameter $ 2.00 per inch of diameter
for the corresponding size pipe, either picked up and delivered. Examples: 24" is $72 per cut per foot + $2.00 per inch Diameter
Note: per foot price is calculated by the weight per foot in pounds (Ibs./ft.) 48" is $144 per cut

provided by the vendor multiplied by the price per pound bid by the vendor.

Bands shall be furnished per foot of band requested with the costtobe ~ 12"-36"is equal to 1 ft.
by the weight per foot of the band multiplied by the price per pound bid ~ 42"-60" is equal to 1.5 ft.

by the vendor. 66" up is equal to 2.0 ft.
Lifting Lugs: $25/ea.

*Note: Gulf Atlantic Culver notates subject to availability of materials

Per Foot X 2

$25/ea.




2022-2023 ACCA METAL PIPE BID TABULATIONS

DELIVERED - EAST CENTRAL REGION
| | | CONTECH | GULFATLANTIC | LOWBID| AWARDED TO | Twin Oaks
ITEM7  [Round Galvanized Metal Plain Pipe $2.09 No Bid $2.09 CONTECH $2.48
ITEM8  [Round Galvanized Pipe Polymeric Coating $2.88 No Bid $2.88 CONTECH No Bid
ITEM9  [Round Aluminized Metal Pipe $2.30 No Bid $2.30 CONTECH $2.60
ITEM 10 [Arched Galvanized Metal Plain Pipe $2.25 No Bid $2.25 CONTECH $2.65
ITEM 11  [Arched Galvanized Pipe Polymeric Coating $3.09 No Bid $3.09 CONTECH No Bid
ITEM 12  [Arched Aluminized Metal Pipe $2.47 No Bid $2.47 CONTECH $2.78
Option Cost Sheet for Corrugated Metal Pipe Option Price
Options: Contech Gulf Atlantic
Sloped ends, cutting pipe will be an additional per foot price 3 x Diameter $2.00 per inch of diameter
for the corresponding size pipe, either picked up and delivered. Examples: 24" is $72 per cut per foot + $2.00 per inch Diameter
Note: per foot price is calculated by the weight per foot in pounds (lbs./ft.) 48" is $144 per cut

provided by the vendor multiplied by the price per pound bid by the vendor.
Bands shall be furnished per foot of band requested with the cost to be  12"-36" is equal to 1 ft.

by the weight per foot of the band multiplied by the price per pound bid ~ 42"-60" is equal to 1.5 ft.
by the vendor. 66" up is equal to 2.0 ft.

Lifting Lugs: $25/ea.

Per Foot X 2

$25/ea.
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