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Asphalt Milling Attachments:
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option A-30 inch 300X Asphalt Zipper $158,180.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option A-42 inch 420X Asphalt Zipper $173,650.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option B-36 inch 360X Asphalt Zipper $170,180.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option B-48 inch 480X Asphalt Zipper $206,275.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option C-48 inch 480Xi Asphalt Zipper $225,765.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option C-72 inch 720Xi Asphalt Zipper $280,320.00
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option D-96 inch 960Xi Asphalt Zipper $299,735.00

Skid Steer Loader and Attachments:
Skid Steer Loader with no attachments Takeughi T112V2 Cowin Equipment Co. $83,121.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 1: Smooth Drum Vibratory Roller Paladin 105064 Cowin Equipment Co. $14,027.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 2:  Pad Foot Vibratory Roller Paladin 105068 Cowin Equipment Co. $14,632.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 3: Grader Blade NO BID

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 4: Angle Broom Angle Broom Paladin 22034 Cowin Equipment Co. $10,731.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 5: Cold Planer RoadHog CP4065 Cowin Equipment Co. $34,142.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 6: Road Widener Single Discharge
Road Widener FH-R Single 

Discharge  Thompson Tractor Co. $68,850.00
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Skid Steer Loader Attachment 7: Road Widener Dual Discharge
Road Widener FH-RD Dual 

Discharge   Thompson Tractor Co. $79,920.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 8: Mulcher Paladin MM60S Cowin Equipment Co. $37,994.00
Paladin MM60H Cowin Equipment Co. $37,388.00
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Backhoes:
Light Duty CAT 416 Thompson Tractor Co. $102,061.00

Medium Duty Deere 320 P Warrior Tractor & Equipment $116,599.00

Heavy Duty-Option A CAT 430 Thompson Tractor Co. $131,070.00

Heavy Duty-Option B NO BID

Heavy Duty-Option C Deere 320 P HL Warrior Tractor & Equipment $118,907.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option A-1 Deere 300 P Warrior Tractor & Equipment $322,731.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option A-2 Volvo EC300E Cowin Equipment Co. $261,222.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option A-3 CAT 330 Thompson Tractor Co. $323,842.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option B-1 Volvo EC220E Cowin Equipment Co. $188,815.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option B-2 Deere 210 P Warrior Tractor & Equipment $237,525.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option B-3 Komatsu PC210LC-11 Tractor & Equipment Co. $257,785.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option C-1 Volvo EC160E Cowin Equipment Co. $174,129.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option C-2 Deere 160 P Warrior Tractor & Equipment $218,980.00



21 Ton Wheeled Excavator CAT M320 Thompson Tractor Co. $325,072.00

19 Ton Wheeled Excavator Volvo EWR170E Cowin Equipment Co. $271,601.00

Highway Speed Truck Mounted Excavator
2 Wheel Drive Gradall D172 Tractor & Equipment Co. $349,475.00

4 Wheel Drive Gradall D154 Tractor & Equipment Co. $370,128.00
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Compact Track Excavators
Compact Track Excavator - Option D-1 Volvo ECR88D Cowin Equipment Co. $119,577.00

Compact Track Excavator - Option D-2 CAT 309 Thompson Tractor Co. $151,152.00

Compact Track Excavator - Option D-3 Takeuchi TB290 Cowin Equipment Co. $108,001.00

Mini Track Excavator - Option E-1 Takeuchi TB240 Cowin Equipment Co. $57,035.00

Motor Graders:
Heavy Duty Motor Grader - Option A CAT 150 Thompson Tractor Co. $365,101.00

Heavy Duty Motor Grader - Option B CAT 140-Steering Wheel Thompson Tractor Co. $325,623.00

Medium Duty Motor Grader - Option A Komatsu GD655-6 Tractor & Equipment Co. $358,865.00

Medium Duty Motor Grader - Option B CAT 140-Joy Stick Thompson Tractor Co. $335,275.00

Medium Duty Motor Grader - Option C SANY SMG-200C-8 TraxPlus $265,000.00



Medium Duty Motor Grader - AWD Deere 672G Warrior Tractor & Equipment $404,108.00

Light Duty Motor Grader - Option A CAT 120-Joystick Thompson Tractor Co. $309,949.00

Light Duty Motor Grader - Option B Deere 670G Warrior Tractor & Equipment $357,800.00

Pothole Patchers:
One Man Pothole Patcher - Option A Leeboy/Rosco RA400 Tractor & Equipment Co. $306,915.00

One Man Pothole Patcher - Option B NO BID

Trailer Mount Patcher - Diesel Option Total Patcher T7500 Warren Power Attachments $88,251.00

Trailer Mount Patcher - Air Compressor/Tools Vortex Warren Power Attachments $95,758.00

Trailer Mount Mastic Patcher/Crack Sealer NO BID
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Asphalt Storage Tanks 3000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $51,619.00

4000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $54,092.00

5000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $61,183.00

6000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $61,371.00

7000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $65,139.00

8000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $69,234.00



9000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $82,612.00

10000 Gallon Tank Warren Power Attachments $83,091.00

Dozers
100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option A Deere 650P Warrior Tractor & Equipment $192,857.00

100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option B CAT D3 Thompson Tractor Co. $193,894.00

100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option C Deere 650P Warrior Tractor & Equipment $194,679.00

100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option D Komatsu D39PX-24 Tractor & Equipment Co. $192,275.00

130 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option A Deere 700L Warrior Tractor & Equipment $220,901.00

130 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option B CAT D4 Thompson Tractor Co. $245,521.00

Mulching Dozer CAT D1  Mulching Thompson Tractor Co. $236,348.00

Half Round End Dump
28 FT. Half Round End Dump MANAC 4H228AB00 Gulf City Body & Trailer $66,370.00

Lowboy Trailer
35 Ton Lowboy Trailer NO BID
55 Ton Lowboy Trailer Pitts LB55-22DC Gulf City Body & Trailer $78,573.00
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Wheel Loaders:
3 CY-Option A CAT 930 Thompson Tractor Co. $245,527.00



3 CY-Option B Deere 544 P Warrior Tractor & Equipment $235,555.00

3 CY-Option C Volvo L70H Cowin Equipment Co. $193,421.00

3.65 CY-Option A CAT 938 Thompson Tractor Co. $274,753.00

3.65 CY-Option B Deere 624P Warrior Tractor & Equipment $264,840.00

Dump Bodies - Old Format
10' Steel Dump Body (Automatic) 10 FT. SA Logan Corporation $21,570.00
15.5' Steel Dump Body-Option A (Automatic) 15.5 LE Logan Corporation $33,560.00
15.5' Steel Dump Body-Option B (Automatic) FL-15.5 Warren Truck & Trailer $32,295.00
16' Steel Dump Body-Option B (Manual) 16 FT. LE Logan Corporation $39,790.00
16' Steel Dump Body-Option B (Automatic) 16 FT. LE Elliptical Steel Body Logan Corporation $41,010.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option D (Manual) 16 FT. LE Logan Corporation $38,920.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option D (Automatic) 16 FT. LE Body Logan Corporation $41,140.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option E (Manual) 16 FT. Maverick 21 CY Childersburg Truck Service $45,669.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option E (Automatic) 16 FT. Maverick 21 CY Childersburg Truck Service $46,251.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option F (Manual) 16 FT. LE Logan Corporation $38,250.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option F (Automatic) 16 FT. LE Logan Corporation $39,560.00

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis - Old Format
Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option A Mack GR64F Nextran Truck Centers $186,437.00

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option B Kenworth T480 Kenworth of Birmingham-Truckworx $166,700.00

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option C Kenworth T880/T880S Kenworth of Birmingham-Truckworx $210,900.00

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option F International HX620 Southland Transportation Group $185,969.05

Heavy Duty Single Axle Dump Chassis Kenworth T280 Kenworth of Birmingham-Truckworx $146,100.00
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Lowboy Tractor:  Old Format
Lowboy Tractor-Option A Mack P64T Nextran Truck Centers $193,404.00

Lowboy Tractor-Option B T880 Kenworth Lowboy Kenworth of Birmingham-Truckworx $232,500.00

Lowboy Tractor-Option E International HX520 Southland Transportation Group $193,172.30

Road Widener:
6ft Road Widener Midland SPR-6 Pittman Tractor Co. $173,821.60
8ft Road Widener Midland SPR-8 Pittman Tractor Co. $258,028.00
Road Widener Attachment-Option A Midland WA Pittman Tractor Co. $156,181.60
Road Widener Attachment-Option B Midland SA Pittman Tractor Co. $124,328.80

Rollers
Rubber Tire Roller Volvo PT125-C Cowin Equipment Co. $103,560.00
7.5 Ton Single Drum Vibratory Roller Dynapac CA1500D Pittman Tractor Co. $110,500.00

Ride-On Industrial Boom Mower-Option A
22 FT. Reach NO BID
24 FT. Reach NO BID
26 FT. Reach NO BID
30 FT. Reach NO BID
Ride-On Industrial Boom Mower-Option B
21 FT. Reach Aspen Fast 6 Warrior Tractor & Equipment $216,329.00
24 FT. Reach Aspen Fast 7 Warrior Tractor & Equipment $221,433.00
30 FT. Reach Aspen Fast 9 Warrior Tractor & Equipment $234,640.00
Ride-On Industrial Boom Mower-Option C
33 FT. Reach Boom T Model Warrior Tractor & Equipment $267,238.00
39 FT. Reach Boom F Model Warrior Tractor & Equipment $325,688.00
Ride-On Industrial Boom Mower-Option D
21-24 Ft. Telescoping Boom Mantis TriGreen Equipment $268,154.45



27-30 Ft. Telescoping Boom Mantis TriGreen Equipment $277,300.10
21 Ft. Hydraulic Wide Area Flail Mower Mantis TriGreen Equipment $380,156.75
21 Ft. Hydraulic Wide Area Rotary Mower Mantis TriGreen Equipment $380,156.75

Asphalt Distributor Truck Etnyre Centennial Cowin Equipment Co. $274,095.00

Chip Spreader Etnyre 9/18 Cowin Equipment Co. $389,857.00
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