
2026
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Asphalt Milling Attachments
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option A-30 inch 300X Asphalt Zipper $175,846.95
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option A-42 inch 420X Asphalt Zipper $195,166.95
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option B-36 inch 360X Asphalt Zipper $183,516.95
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option B-48 inch 480X Asphalt Zipper $221,256.95
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option C-48 inch 480Xi Asphalt Zipper $249,480.75
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option C-72 inch 720Xi Asphalt Zipper $303,320.75
Asphalt Milling Attachment – Option D-96 inch 960Xi Asphalt Zipper $324,243.50

Skid Steer Loader and Attachments
Skid Steer Loader with No Attachments Takeuchi TL12V2 CRHR Cowin Equipment Co. $94,287.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 1: Smooth Drum Vibratory Roller Paladin 105063 Cowin Equipment Co. $14,209.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 2:  Pad Foot Vibratory Roller Paladin 105067 Cowin Equipment Co. $15,233.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 3: Grader Blade NO BID

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 4: Angle Broom Paladin 22084 Cowin Equipment Co. $11,462.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 5: Cold Planer
Paladin 114440 or Road 

Hog CP40G5 Cowin Equipment Co. $42,963.00
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Skid Steer Loader Attachment 6: Road Widener Single Discharge
Road Widener RW-1001001 

Single Discharge  Thompson Tractor Co. $71,500.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 7: Road Widener Dual Discharge
Road Widener RW-1003001 

Dual Discharge    Thompson Tractor Co. $82,500.00

Skid Steer Loader Attachment 8: Mulcher Paladin MM60 Cowin Equipment Co. $42,189.00
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Backhoes
Light Duty CAT 416 Thompson Tractor Co. $100,767.00

Medium Duty Deere 320 P-Tier Warrior Tractor & Equipment $123,344.00

Heavy Duty-Option A CAT 430 Thompson Tractor Co. $128,589.00

Heavy Duty-Option B Deere 320 P-Tier HL Warror Tractor & Equipment $132,287.00

Heavy Duty-Option C Deere 320 P-Tier HL Warrior Tractor & Equipment $125,659.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option A-1 Deere 300 P-Tier Warrior Tractor & Equipment $319,420.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option A-2 Volvo EC300 Cowin Equipment Co. $283,163.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option A-3 CAT 330 Thompson Tractor Co. $307,372.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option B-1 Volvo EC230 Cowin Equipment Co. $208,783.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option B-2 Deere 210 P-Tier Warrior Tractor & Equipment $238,930.00



Track Mount Excavator - Option B-3 Komatsu PC220LC-12 Tractor & Equipment Co. $247,600.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option C-1 Volvo EC160E Cowin Equipment Co. $179,042.00

Track Mount Excavator - Option C-2 Deere 160 P-Tier Warrior Tractor & Equipment $221,708.00

21 Ton Wheeled Excavator CAT M320 Thompson Tractor Co. $327,443.00

19 Ton Wheeled Excavator Volvo EWR170 Cowin Equipment Co. $262,459.00

Highway Speed Truck Mounted Excavator
2 Wheel Drive Gradall D172 Tractor & Equipment Co. $362,000.00

4 Wheel Drive Gradall D174 Tractor & Equipment Co. $383,300.00
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Compact Track Excavators
Compact Track Excavator - Option D-1 Deere 75 P-Tier Warrior Tractor & Equipment $118,842.00

Compact Track Excavator - Option D-2 CAT 309 Thompson Tractor Co. $139,512.00

Compact Track Excavator - Option D-3 Takeuchi TB290 Cowin Equipment Co. $120,204.00

Mini Track Excavator - Option E-1 Takeuchi TB240 Cowin Equipment Co. $60,232.00

Motor Graders
Heavy Duty Motor Grader - Option A  *New Pricing Effective 7/1/26 CAT 150 Thompson Tractor Co. $372,057.00



Heavy Duty Motor Grader - Option B  *New Pricing Effective 7/1/26 CAT 140-Steering Wheel Thompson Tractor Co. $324,362.00

Medium Duty Motor Grader - Option A Komatsu GD655-6 Tractor & Equipment Co. $372,320.00

Medium Duty Motor Grader - Option B  *New Pricing Effective 7/1/26 CAT 140-Joystick Steering Thompson Tractor Co. $340,795.00

Medium Duty Motor Grader - Option C NO BID

Medium Duty Motor Grader - AWD Deere 672 P-Tier Warrior Tractor & Equipment $418,523.00

Light Duty Motor Grader - Option A CAT 120-Joystick Steering Thompson Tractor Co. $325,481.00

Light Duty Motor Grader - Option B NO BID

Pothole Patchers
One Man Pothole Patcher - Option A Rosco RA-400 Tractor & Equipment Co. $341,600.00

One Man Pothole Patcher - Option B DuraPatcher P5 Cimline, Inc. $320,805.00

Trailer Mount Patcher - Diesel Option T7500 Warren DBA Total Patcher $89,562.00

Trailer Mount Patcher - Air Compressor/Tools Vortex Warren DBA Total Patcher $96,950.00

Trailer Mount Mastic Patcher/Crack Sealer NO BID
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Asphalt Storage Tanks 3000 Gallon Tank Cimline $53,010.00



4000 Gallon Tank Cimline $58,731.00

5000 Gallon Tank Cimline $61,881.00

6000 Gallon Tank Cimline $65,661.00

7000 Gallon Tank Cimline $69,441.00

8000 Gallon Tank Cimline $73,221.00

9000 Gallon Tank Cimline $77,001.00

10000 Gallon Tank Cimline $77,001.00

Dozers
100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option A Deere 650 P-Tier Warrior Tractor & Equipment $196,437.00

100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option B CAT D3 Thompson Tractor Co. $198,967.00

100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option C Deere 650 P-Tier Warrior Tractor & Equipment $196,437.00

100 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option D Komatsu D39PX-24 Tractor & Equipment Co. $198,500.00

130 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option A Deere 700 P-Tier Warrior Tractor & Equipment $230,588.00
   

130 HP Heavy Duty Hydrostatic Bulldozer-Option B CAT D4 Thompson Tractor Co. $270,531.00

Mulching Dozer NO BID

Half Round End Dump
28 FT. Half Round End Dump MANAC 4H228A000 Gulf City Body & Trailer $66,370.00



Lowboy Trailers
35 Ton Lowboy Trailer Pitts LB35 Gulf City Body & Trailer $50,129.29
55 Ton Lowboy Trailer Pitts LB55-DC Gulf City Body & Trailer $78,581.89
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Wheel Loaders
3 CY-Option A CAT 930 Thompson Tractor Co. $247,086.00

3 CY-Option B Deere 544 P-Tier Warrior Tractor & Equipment $232,401.00

3 CY-Option C Volvo L70H Cowin Equipment Co. $214,289.00

3.65 CY-Option A CAT 938 Thompson Tractor Co. $276,287.00

3.65 CY-Option B Deere 624 P-Tier Warrior Tractor & Equipment $264,036.00

Dump Bodies - Old Format
10' Steel Dump Body (Automatic) 10 Ft. Stockyard Ox Bodies, Inc. $21,529.51

15.5' Steel Dump Body-Option A (Automatic) 15.5 Ft. Logan LE Logan Corporation $39,910.00

15.5' Steel Dump Body-Option B (Automatic) 15.5 Ft. Logan LS Logan Corporation $43,245.00

16' Steel Dump Body-Option B (Manual) Stampede Ox Bodies, Inc. $41,828.57
16' Steel Dump Body-Option B (Automatic) Stampede Ox Bodies, Inc. $42,542.56

16’ Steel Dump Body-Option D (Manual) 16 Ft. Logan LE Logan Corporation $42,480.00
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option D (Automatic) 16 Ft. Logan LE Logan Corporation $43,250.00



16’ Steel Dump Body-Option E (Manual) 16 Ft. Maverick Ox Bodies, Inc. $44,227.54
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option E (Automatic) 16 Ft. Maverick Ox Bodies, Inc. $44,963.94

16’ Steel Dump Body-Option F (Manual) Stampede Ox Bodies, Inc. $42,272.06
16’ Steel Dump Body-Option F (Automatic) Stampede Ox Bodies, Inc. $43,007.35

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis - Old Format
Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option A Mack Granite 64FR Nextran Truck Centers $191,368.00

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option B Peterbilt 548 Peterbilt of LaGrange $137,931.00
  

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option C
Kenworth T880S (Set 
Forward Axle) / T880 Truckworx Kenworth $192,850.00

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option D
Peterbilt 567 (Set Forward 

Front Axle) Peterbilt of LaGrange $188,968.00

Heavy Duty Dump Chassis-Option F International HX620 Southland Transportation Group $188,811.50

Heavy Duty Single Axle Dump Chassis Peterbilt 536 Peterbilt of LaGrange $115,417.00
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Lowboy Tractors - Old Format
Lowboy Tractor-Option A Mack Pinnacle 64T Nextran Truck Centers $192,487.00

Lowboy Tractor-Option B T880 Truckworx Kenworth $220,900.00

Lowboy Tractor-Option C Peterbilt 567 Peterbilt of LaGrange $199,990.00



Lowboy Tractor-Option E International HX520 Southland Transportation Group $198,739.91

Road Wideners
6 Ft. Road Widener Midland SPR-6 Pittman Tractor Co. $192,718.90
8 Ft. Road Widener Midland SPD-8 Pittman Tractor Co. $282,254.50
Road Widener Attachment-Option A Midland WA Pittman Tractor Co. $160,701.40
Road Widener Attachment-Option B Midland SA Pittman Tractor Co. $137,990.80

Rollers
Rubber Tire Roller Hamm HP180i Tractor & Equipment Co. $174,400.00

7.5 Ton Single Drum Vibratory Roller Dynapac CA1500D Pittman Tractor Co. $126,735.00

Mowers
Ride-On Industrial Boom Mower-Option A
24 Ft. Reach for the 22 Ft. Aspen Fast 7 Warrior Tractor & Equipment $242,909.67
24 Ft. Reach NO BID
26 Ft. Reach NO BID
30 Ft. Reach for the 27-30 Ft. (Telescoping) Aspen Fast 9 Warrior Tractor & Equipment $263,250.99

Ride-On Industrial Boom Mower-Option B
31 Ft. Boom F Model NO BID
36 Ft. Boom F Model NO BID
39 Ft. Boom F Model NO BID
26 Ft. Boom T Model NO BID
33 Ft. Boom T Model Alpha T10 33 Ft. Boom Warrior Tractor & Equipment $299,954.03
39 Ft. Boom T Model NO BID

Ride-On Industrial Boom Mower-Option C
31 Ft. Boom F Model NO BID
36 Ft. Boom F Model NO BID



39 Ft. Boom F Model NO BID
26 Ft. Boom T Model NO BID
33 Ft. Boom T Model Alpha T10 33 Ft. Boom Warrior Tractor & Equipment $299,954.03
39 Ft. Boom T Model NO BID
32 Ft. Boom 3P Model NO BID

Ride-On Industrial Boom Mower-Option D
21-24 Ft. Telescoping Boom Mantis MTS155BF TriGreen Equipment $274,549.68
27-30 Ft. Telescoping Boom Mantis MTS155BF TriGreen Equipment $283,561.02
21 Ft. Hydraulic Wide Area Flail Mower Mantis MTS201PF TriGreen Equipment $311,198.94
21 Ft. Hydraulic Wide Area Rotary Mower Mantis MTS201PF TriGreen Equipment $311,198.94

Asphalt Distributor Truck Etnyre Black Topper Cowin Equipment Co. $326,209.00

Chip Spreader Etnyre CS Cowin Equipment Co. $406,103.00
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